RESOLUITON 2021-11-08-04

BE IT RESOLVED, that the Shelby County Commission hereby awards the bid for Hygiene items to
the lowest overall bidder, Bob Barker as attached.

Said ebid 2021-9-11201 is located within the County Manager’s Office.



Amercare Bob Barker Charm-tex ICS JAIL Pacific Link j
2 oz Clear liquid 29.80/96 22.50/96 32.90/96 | 43.00/96 35.50/96
Shave, Shower and
Shampoo
2 oz Clear liquid 29.80/96 22.50/96 32.90/96 |37.17/96 35.50/96
Shave, Shower and
Shampoo
(animal fat-free option)
4 oz. Clear liquid 31.20/60 25.35/60 32.90/60 | 41.46/60 31.50/60
Shave, Shower and
Shampoo
4 oz Clear liquid 31.20/60 25.35/60 32.90/60 | 36.07/60 31.50/60
Shave, Shower and
Shampoo
(animal fat-free option)
Bar Soap 49.95/500 69.00/500 59.90/500 - 74.19/500 69.75/500
Thothbrush 71.90/1440 7.49/144 79.90/1440 |9.23 /144 84.75/1440
o
| dlear Toothpaste 35.95/144 36.72/144 39.90/144 |50.44/144 39.75/144
Clear Toothpaste 35.95/144 36.72/144 39.90/144 42.96/144 39.75/144
(animal fat-free option)
sanitary Napkins 20.15/250 36.86/576 59.00/864 |24.45/250 No bid
Lice Control Shampoo | 132.00/4 47.50/1 42.90/1 212.55/4 No bid
1 gallon w/ pump
Lice Control Shampoo | 36.00/24 54.72/1 case No bid 242.94/12 - 4oz No bid
202
e ool perosol | 76.41/12 - 100z | 81.96/12—16 0z Nobid  |91.38/12—17.5 0z |Nobid
pray
Pahi Senior 78.75/1 82.95/1 No bid 55.79/1 No bid
professional Hair
Clippers
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