RESOLUTION 2021-02-08-09

BE IT RESOLVED, that the Shelby County Commission hereby awards the Emergency
Medical Services Fire Equipment bid to the lowest responsive vendor per each item listed
according to bid specifications at the contract price listed for each unit.

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that the Shelby County Commission hereby records
that no bids were received for items 12F, 28F, 29F, 30F, 39F, 51F, 52F, 61F, 64F and
67F. Therefore, purchases will be made for these items as outlined by the State of Alabama Bid
Laws.

Equipment Item Vendor Price Nafeco Walter Craig NOTES:
No.
6” NH Male x
Female X 10
Suction Hose Nafeco $364.78 $364.78
57 x 100°
Nitrile Supply
Hose Nafeco $552.88 $552.88
1.75” attack
hose Nafeco $135.64 $135.64
2.25” attack
hose Nafeco $204.60 $204.60
2.5” attack
hose Nafeco $184.49 $184.49
3” supply line
hose Nafeco $197.71 $197.71
17 x 50°
Forestry hose Nafeco $72.94 $72.94
1”7 nozzle Nafeco $718.00 $718.00
5 gal ply back
pack Nafeco $158.88 $158.88
6” Female
NH Long
Handle
siphon Nafeco $427.77 $427.77
57 STORZ
inlet gated
wye Nafeco $396.00 $396.00
5” STORZ No Bid
5 Way
manifold Nafeco $1,364.00 $1,364.00
6” NH
Female outlet Nafeco $1,509.83 $1,509.83
Mounting
bracket
adapter Nafeco $36.47 $36.47
5” x two 2-
1/2 Siamese Nafeco $264.00 $264.00
5”x2-1/2nh
female swivel
adapter Nafeco $129.41 $129.41
57 x 6” nh
female swivel
adapter Nafeco $198.00 $198.00
Water Thief Nafeco $1,081.00 $1,081.00
5” cap with
chain Nafeco $72.94 $72.94
2.5” hydrant
gate valve Nafeco $208.23 $208.23
Hydrant
Assist Valve Nafeco $1,325.59 $1,325.59
2500 gal
dump tank Nafeco $1,132.00 $1,132.00




Foam

educator
pyrolite 95
gpm Nafeco $634.49 $634.49
Set of 4 x
Spanner
Wrench and
Holder Nafeco $79.81 $79.81
2.5 gallon
dump tank Nafeco $99.81 $99.81
v2”
Kemamantle
rope Nafeco $248.00 $248.00
K-12 Saw No Bid -
Chain Saw No Bid -
Chain Saw
battery
powered No Bid -
Rope Bag Nafeco $88.24 $88.24
Stanless Steel
Locking
Carabineer Nafeco $55.30 $55.30
MPD 13 mm
device Nafeco $753.00 $753.00
6 pound Flat
Head Axe Nafeco $57.64 $57.64
6 pound Pick
Head Axe Nafeco $56.64 $56.64
3> drywall
hook w/butt
handle Nafeco $71.59 $71.59
3” drywall
hook w/D
handle Nafeco $84.00 $84.00
Firehooks
Unlimited 6’
NY Hook Nafeco $136.00 $136.00
36” Halligan
Tool No Bid -
Firehooks
Unlimited
Probar
Halligan Tool Nafeco $253.00 $253.00
81b
sledgehammer Nafeco $59.00 $59.00
10 1b
sledgehammer Nafeco $65.00 $65.00
4 Pike pole
w/D handle Nafeco $64.71 $64.71
4 drywall
hook w/butt
handle Nafeco $74.71 $74.71
6’ pike pole
w/butt handle Nafeco $63.71 $63.71
12’ pike pole
w/butt handle Nafeco $135.00 $135.00
Steck big easy
lock out tool Nafeco $72.00 $72.00
Steck Big easy
lock out tool
case Nafeco $91.00 $91.00
Firemans
rope hose
tool Nafeco $43.00 $43.00
Quick deploy
spring traffic
cone, 5 cone
bag Nafeco $134.00 $134.00
4 Gas
monitor No Bid -
Co Gas
monitor No Bid -
Door Bar Nafeco $231.00 $231.00
W-tool-qc Nafeco $1,470.00 $1,470.00




Landing zone
kit

Nafeco

$274.00

$274.00

E Spotlight
Litebox
Portable

handlight

Walter Craig

$154.50

$158.83

$154.50

E-flood
litebox HI.
rechargeable
landtern

Walter Craig

$171.74

$171.82

$171.74

Litebox
hi/low power
portable led
handlight

Walter Craig

$167.10

$168.00

$167.10

Survivor
portable led
handlight

Nafeco

$116.00

$116.00

$116.93

Portable
scene light
rechargeable
lantern

Nafeco

$628.00

$628.00

$632.25

Whelen LF35
Light

No Bid

Rechargeable

pistol grip
waypoint 300

Nafeco

$104.51

$104.51

$105.46

Lime Green
safety vest

Walter Craig

$9.40

$19.75

$9.40

Structural Fire
Helmet

No Bid

FLIR K2
Series

Nafeco

$1,413.00

$1,413.00

Bat Fan

Nafeco

$4,811.00

$4,811.00

Back pack
blower

No Bid

15
fog/straight
stream nozzle

Nafeco

$769.00

$769.00

1.75”
fog/straight

stream nozzle

Nafeco

$769.00

$769.00

557
fog/straight

stream nozzle

Nafeco

$844.00

$844.00

Rapid Attack
Nozzle

Nafeco

$2,898.00

$2,898.00

4%
NH Rigid
Rocker Lug
Female x 5
male

Nafeco

$119.00

$119.00

Said eBid 2020-12-11134 is located within the County Manager’s Office.




