RESOLUTION 2021-02-08-07

BE IT RESOLVED, that the Shelby County Commission hereby awards the Emergency
Medical Services Advanced Life Support items bid to the lowest responsive vendor per each
item listed according to bid specifications at the contract price listed for each unit.

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that the Shelby County Commission hereby records
that no bids were received for items 1A, 2A, 3A, 4A, 5A, and 6A. Therefore, purchases will be
made for these items as outlined by the State of Alabama Bid Laws.

Equipment Vendor Price Bound Henry Quad Walt NOTES
Tree Schein Med Craig
LLC

Ez-i0 Power
Driver No bid - -

EZ-10
Pediatric
Needle Set No bid - - - -

EZ-10 Adult
Needle Set No bid - - - -

EZ-10 Hard
Sides Case No bid - - _ -

EZ-10
Vascular
Access Pack No bid - - _ -

EZ-10
Complete
Training Kit No bid - - - -

NIO
Intraosseous
Device Adult Bound Ttree $110.90 $100.90 - - -

NIO
Intraosseous
Dev Pediatric Bound Tree $100.90 $100.90 - - -

Length Based
Resuscitation

Tape Quad Med $29.84 - - $29.84 -

ET Tube
Holder Adult Bound Tree & Henry Schein $2.66 $2.66 $2.66 $3.28 -

ET Tube
Holder
Pediatric Bound Tree & Henry Schein $2.66 $2.66 $2.66 $3.81 -

ET Tube
Introducer Henry Schein $3.72 $4.64 $3.72 $6.92 -

Video
Laryngoscope
Kit Bound Tree $1,211.18 | $1,211.18 | $1,273.55 | $1,475.00 -

Uescope
VL400 Video
Kit Bound Tree $2,369.95 | $2,369.95 - - -

Portable
Suction Unit Bound Tree $526.15 $526.15 $527.27 $540.00 -

Said eBid 2020-12-11133 is located within the County Manager’s Office.



