
 

RESOLUTION 2021-02-08-06 

 

 BE IT RESOLVED, that the Shelby County Commission hereby awards the Emergency 

Medical Services Basic Life Support bid to the lowest responsive vendor per each item listed 

according to bid specifications at the contract price listed for each unit. 

 

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that the Shelby County Commission hereby records 

that no bids were received for items 14B, 15B, 18B and 19B.  Therefore, purchases will be made 

for these items as outlined by the State of Alabama Bid Laws.   

 

 
Equipment  Vendor Price Bound 

Tree 
Henry 
Schein 

Quad Med Walter 
Craig LLC 

NOTES 

I-gel  
Size 2  Henry Schein $13.35 $14.90 $13.35 $14.30 -   

I-gel Size 3  Henry Schein $22.22 $24.20 $22.22 $23.80 -   

I-gel Size 4  Henry Schein $22.22 $24.20 $22.22 $23.80 -   

I-gel Size 5  Henry Schein $22.22 $24.20 $22.22 $23.80 -   

CPAP  Bound Tree $24.55 $24.55 - - -   

Adult BVM  Bound Tree $8.70 $8.70 $9.32 $11.50 -   

Pediatric 
BVM  Quad Med $13.59 $18.64 $20.00 $13.59 -   

Infant BVM  Quad Med $13.59 $23.22 $20.00 $13.59 -   

Oxygen Cyl 
D  Quad Med $50.37 $57.64 $56.29 $50.37 -   

Oxygen 
Regulator  Bound Tree $88.45 $88.45 - - -   

Hand 
Powered 
Suction 

Unit  Bound Tree $87.25 $87.25 $88.35 $100.95 -   

Glucometer 
Kit 2/strips  Henry Schein $7.95 $10.99 $7.95 - -   

Hemostatic 
Agent 

QuikClot  Henry Schein $33.75 $34.28 $33.75 $35.73 -   

Hemostatic 
Agent 
Nustat 
Tactical  No Bid $0.00 - - - -   

Agent 
Nustat 
Trauma 

Pads B No Bid $0.00 - - - -   

Oxygen 
Trauma Bag 

D  Henry Schein $296.67 $305.44 $296.67 - -   

Ferno 
Airway 
Mgmt  Bound Tree $259.89 $259.89 $273.12 - -   

Basic 
Emergency   No Bid $0.00 - - - -   



Care Bag 
Filled 

Basic 
Airway/Ox
y Kit Filled  No Bid $0.00 - - - -   

Statpack G3 
AED 

Backpack  Henry Schein $153.40 $172.59 $153.40 - -   

Adult Blood 
Pressure 

Cuff  Henry Schein $6.12 $6.65 $6.12 $37.20 -   

Lg Adult 
BP Cuff  Bound Tree $6.49 $6.49 $6.81 $42.98 -   

Multi-cuff 
BP Kit  Bound Tree $55.36 $55.36 $98.20 $127.25 -   

Stethoscope  Bound Tree $9.83 $9.83 - $10.80 -   

High 
Quality 

Stethoscope  Bound Tree $86.13 $86.13 $94.76 $87.20 -   

Ped 
Stethoscope  Bound Tree $4.44 $4.44 - - -   

Finger Pulse 
Oximeter  Bound Tree $22.36 $22.36 $35.27 $248.75 -   

Clipboard  Bound Tree $20.79 $20.79 - - -   

Shears  Henry Schein $0.62 $0.76 $0.62 - -   

Combat 
App 

Tourniquet  Henry Schein $21.29 $24.40 $21.29 $23.05 -   

SWAT-T 
tourniquet  Bound Tree $8.33 $8.33 - $9.22 -   

N95 
Respirator 

Med  Bound Tree $20.75 $20.75 - - -   

N95 
Respirator 

Lg  Bound Tree $20.75 $20.75 - - -   

MCI Bag  Bound Tree $910.71 $910.71 - - -   

Gloves, 
Med  Bound Tree $185.30 $185.00 - - -   

Gloves, Lg  Bound Tree $185.30 $185.00 - - -   

Gloves, XL  Bound Tree $185.00 $185.00 - - -   

 
Nasopha

ryngeal 

airways  

lube 

 Henry Schein $1.50 $1.53 $1.50 - -  

Hyfin 

Vent 

Seal 

 Henry Schein $8.81 $13.51 $8.81 $13.05 -  

 

 

Said eBid 2020-12-11131 is located within the County Manager’s Office. 


