RESOLUTION 2020-02-10-08

BE IT RESOLVED that the Shelby County Commission hereby awards the bid for Cleaning Items
to the overall lowest bidder, Budget Janitorial as attached.

Said eBid 2019-12-11058 is located within the County Manager’s Office.



AMERICAN OSMENT BUDGET JANITORIAL STRICKLAND COMPANIES ALL AMERICAN POLY INTERBORO
, OPTION B
General Purpose 14.00 case 10 per bag
Scouring Pad (6 boxes of 10 per case) | $4.52/bag
.28 each .23 each .45 each
Medium-Duty Scrub 23.04 case 5 per pack
Sponge (24 per case) 8.67/pack
.96 each .96 each 1.73 each
Stripping pad 18.00 case 10 per box
(20 per case) 41.81/box
3.55 each .90 each 4.18 each
Floor Scrub (accepts
threaded handle 4.50 each 8.00 each 15.76 each
Scrub Brush with
Handle 3.95 each 4.75 each 5.77 each
10” Nylon Brush 13.46 each 8.75 each No Bid
Handle for Nylon 2.60 each 3.05 each No Bid
Brush
Stainless Steel 55.65 case No Bid
Sponge 6pk / 12 ea.
.76 each .77 each
Broom Head 10.20 each 9.85 each No Bid
Heavy Duty Dust pan | 5.54 each 2.80 each 6.03 each
Broom Handle 16.75 each 8.50 each 15.85 each

Large Web Foot Mop
Head

6 per carton
$116.59/ct




AMERICAN OSMENT BUDGET JANITORIAL STRICKLAND COMPANIES ALL AMERICAN POLY INTERBORO
OPTION B

24 x 33 High Density | 22.65 15.84 14.85 24,33 14.48
Can Liners (1000)
33 x 40 High Density | 17.10 23.50 15.30 19.38 15.82
Can Liners (250)
38 x 58 Extra Heavy 21.90 24.90 23.85 15.25 14.72
Duty Trash Bag (100)
Toilet Bowl Mop with 25 per carton
12” Handle 18.72/carton

.75 each 1.60 each .75 each
1 gallon bleach 15.61 16.34/carton

6 per carton 3 per carton

2.85 each 2.60 each 5.45 each
Pine Sol 44.20/case 29.82 / case 33.31/carton

4 per case 3 per case 3 per carton

1 gallon 1 gallon 1 gallon

11.05 each 9.94 each 11.10 each
Comet 28.80/case 38.16/case 37.52/carton

24 per case 24 per case 24 per carton

21 ounce 21 ounce 21 ounce

1.20 each 1.59 each 1.56 each

64.10 each 98.40/ case 34.42/case
DumpsterD & C 25 Ib bucket 12 per case 12 per case

320Z each 16 ounce ea
400 oz total 384 oz total/case 192 oz total/case
.16 ounce .26 ounce .18 ounce




AMERICAN OSMENT BUDGET JANITORIAL STRICKLAND COMPANIES ALL AMERICAN POLY INTERBORO
OPTION B
(1” Headband,
Antimicrobial,
Looped Ends, able to | 8.05 each 7.95 each 19.43 each
withstand frequent
laundering)
Mop Handle 14.25 each 11.80 each No Bid
36” Soft Rubber 28.35 each ltem bid was 22" No Bid
Squeegee
36" Hard Rubber 24.80 each 19.70 each No Bid
Squeegee
Squeegee Handle 10.05 each 3.90 each No Bid
Black Stripping Pad 16.50 case 5 per carton
(5 per case) 19.82/carton
4.04 each 3.30 each 3.96 each
Pink eraser Pad 16.50 case 5 per carton
(5 per case) 29.00/carton
4.15 each 3.30 each 5.80 each
QOven and Grill 94.80 case 87.84 case No bid
Gleaner (12/320z) (12/320z)
7.90 each 7.32 each
Mr. Muscle Boil Out | 50.65 case 36.12 case 41.37/carton
Fryer Cleaner (36/202) (9/20z) (36 per carton)
1.41 each 4.01 each 1.15 each




AMERICAN OSMENT BUDGET JANITORIAL STRICKLAND COMPANIES ALL AMERICAN POLY INTERBORO
OPTION B
Clorox Disinfecting 63.60/case 33.00/case 4.67 each
Spray 12 per case 12 per case 19 ounce
20 ounce 19 ounce
240 ounces/case 228 ounces/case
.27 ounce .14 ounce .25 ounce
44.40/case 41.50/case 4.12 each
Joy Dishwashing 8 per case 8 per case 38 ounce
Liquid 38 ounce 38 ounce
304 ounce total 304 ounce total
5.55 each 5.19 each 4.12 each
50 Ib box Huck 111.50 46.50 80.58
Towels 50 lbs 25 lbs 25 Ibs

(seamed on ends)

2.23 per pound

1.86 per pound

3.22 per pound




