

## RESOLUTION 2024-04-22-07

**BE IT RESOLVED**, the Shelby County Commission hereby awards the bid for Property Tax Commission Printed Items to the lowest responsive bidder for each item as highlighted below. The awarded bidders are Checkomatic, Inc., Precision Graphics, Inc. and KM Printing, LLC.

	Precision Graphics, Inc.			KM Printing, LLC DBA Strategic Factory			Checkomatic, Inc		
Quantities	500	1,000	2,500	500	1,000	2,500	500	1,000	2,500
1.) Manilla Envelope 9x12	228.00	343.00	598.00	179.00	249.00	415.00	149.50	230.25	467.25
2.) Manilla Envelope 9x6	183.00	263.00	433.00	149.00	210.00	339.00	93.25	145.25	286.25
3.) White Business Envelope with return address	187.00	203.00	268.00	99.00	135.00	195.00	54.20	70.35	148.50
4.) White Business Envelope with window and return address	195.00	212.00	290.00	99.00	135.00	195.00	50.75	74.50	158.75
5.) Yellow Half Sheet Form Padded	155.00	197.00	267.00	1710.00	2495.00	5799.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
6.) Blue Door Hanger	435.00	470.00	578.00	149.00	195.00	339.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

Said eBid #2024-3-11469 is located in the office of the Chief Financial Officer.