RESOLUTION 2024-03-11-04

BE IT RESOLVED, that the Shelby County Commission hereby awards the bid for
Restroom Supply Products to the lowest responsive bidder for each item as highlighted

below:
Scott % Off
NaEadn Tork — Multi- Foaming Below
M29 Bath Single Towpels / fold Antibacterial Retail or
BIDDER Ti Roll Bath Towels/ Skin List Cost
issue/case Ti case cl Oth
(12 rolls) issue (6 rolls) case eanser er
(96 rolls) (4,000 (6 each) Catalog
ea.) Items
Always 7
Available $24.24 $50.16 $36.73 $53.96 No Bid 25%
Wholesales
American
Osment/Imper $21.20 $41.00 $31.45 | $28.95 No Bid 25%
ial Dade
ARG I'ii"ab'e’ $35.42 $39.73 | $32.64 | $21.85 $89.94 15%
Budget
Janitorial $21.85 $37.80 $29.10 $25.25 $57.90 25%
Supply, Inc.
Central Paper : .
Company $19.95 $40.60 $25.30 No Bid No Bid 25%
KA, Rony $26.00 $56.00 | $37.00 & $31.00 No Bid 0%
Bag Corp. - * : : v
ODP
Business : =
Solutions, $41.57 $72.88 $45.40 $28.18 No Bid 30%
LLC
Strickland
Paper Co., $23.09 $39.00 $28.30 | $22.58 $59.45 35%
Inc.

Said eBid #2024-2-11450 is located within the County Manager's Office.




