RESOLUTION 2023-03-13-05

BE IT RESOLVED, the Shelby County Commission hereby awards the bid for Concrete
Pipe — Picked-Up to the lowest responsive bidder for each item as attached.

Said eBid 2023-2-11344 is located within the County Manager’s Office.



CONCRETE PIPE PICKUP TABULATION

PICKUP PICKUP
FOLEY PIPE ALABAMA PIPE
PRICE PER LF PRICE PER LF
POPIT PLUGS $2.50 ea
$180.00 box $187.50 box
75 per box 75 per box
ROUND PICKUP PICKUP
FOLEY PIPE | ALABAMA PIPE
ITEM NO SIZE TYPE CLASS| PRICE PER LF| PRICE PER LF
1 12" RCP 3 FF 3 NO BID
2 15" RCP 3 BB s $26.36
3 18" RCP 3 b : $29.48
4 24" RCP 3 B $43.31
5 30" RCP 3 | $64.71
6 36" RCP 3 B $84.11
7 42" RCP 3 | $118.49
8 48" RCP 3 $155.98
9 54" RCP 3 B $173.42
10 60" RCP 3 $214.88 R
11 66" RCP 3 $295.31 NO BID
12 7> RCP 3 $319.56 i | Theodore
13 78" RCP 3 NO BID NO BID
14 84" RCP 3 B NO BID
ARCH PICKUP PICKUP
FOLEY PIPE | ALABAMA PIPE
ITEM NO SIZE TYPE CLASS| PRICE PER LF | PRICE PER LF
1 (18 X 11) 15 RCP 3 b $47.96
2 (22 X 12) 18" RCP 3 b $49.48
3 (29 X 18) 24" RCP 3 B $71.32
4 (36 X 23) 30" RCP 3 B 3 $101.21
5 (44 X 27) 36" RCP 3 $130.96
6 (51X 31) 42" RCP 3 $167.97
7 (58 X 36) 48" RCP 3 BN S $218.29
8 (85 X 40) 54" RCP 3 $266.51 | 62
9 ( 73 X 45) 60" RCP 3 $332.55
10 (88 X 54) 72" RCP 3 $440.58
11 (102 X 62) 84" RCP 3 NO BID




CONCRETE PIPE PICKUP TABULATION

STRAIGHT WALL PICKUP PICKUP
FOLEY PIPE | ALABAMA PIPE
ITEM NO SIZE TYPE CLASS| PRICE PER LF| PRICE PER LF
1 12" RCP STRAIGHT WALL | 3 NO BID NO BID
2 15" RCP STRAIGHT WALL | 3 NO BID NO BID
3 18" RCP STRAIGHT WALL | 3 NO BID NO BID
4 24" RCP STRAIGHT WALL | 3 NO BID NO BID
5 30" RCP STRAIGHT WALL | 3 NO BID NO BID
6 38" RCP STRAIGHT WALL | 3 NO BID NO 8ID
7 42" RCP STRAIGHT WALL | 3 $96.06 $118.49
8 48" RCP STRAIGHT WALL 3 $155.98
9 54" RCP STRAIGHT WALL 3 B $173.42
10 60" RCP STRAIGHT WALL | 3 $21488 | 5208119
11 66" RCP STRAIGHTWALL | 3 | L
12 72" RCP STRAIGHT WALL | 3 $319.56
13 78" RCP STRAIGHT WALL | 3 NO BID
14 84" RCP STRAIGHT WALL 3 | 654009 NO 8ID




