
RESOLUTION 2022-08-22-04

BE IT RESOLVED, that the Shelby County Commission hereby awards the bid for Access Control

Hardware to the lowest responsive bidder for each item as highlighted below. The award

bidders are Accredited Lock Supply Co., Convergint, Crosby Communications, LLC and Basesix

Systems, LLC.

Accredited

Lock Supply

Co. Convergint

Crosby

Communications

LLC

Basesix Systems

LLC

Avigilon EP 1502 2 Reader Host ontroller board No Bid $1,101.03 $1,156.00 $1,084.00

Avigilon MRS2 2 Reader controller board No Bid $636.64 $637.00 $597.00

HES 1006 -12/24 Electric door strike $274.50 $432.35 $539.00 $530.00

HES 9600 -12/24 Electric door strike $239.25 $323.06 $491.00 $370.00

HES 5000 - 12/24V Electric strike $81.85 $135.47 $159.00 $137.00

HES Faceplate-FP:501-630 $9.35 $13.61 $20.00 $17.00

600DLB - 6001b Magnetic door lock w/h Bond

Sensor $197.55 $288.44 $403.00 $356.00

600 LB - 6001b Magnetic door lock $138.15 $185.88 $285.00 $189.00

1200LB - 12001b Magnetic door lock $177.30 $271.73 $300.00 $280.00

SN-EEB3 - Emergency Exit button $70.40 $98.70 $128.00 $127.00

SR-1078CW - Door contact No Bid $19.64 $18.00 $10.00

OL-TREXXL- Request to Exit switch No Bid $96.14 $120.00 $111,00

HID Reader 5395-chlOO No Bid $189.28 $251.00 $246.00

EEB2 Emergency Exit button $70.40 $103.66 $128.00 $105.00

EEB2N Narrow Emergency Exit button $70.40 $90.29 $128.00 $127.00

7 Amp hour 12v battery No Bid $34.60 $30.00 $35.00

500' Access Control wire

22AWG/3P+18AW6/4C+22AWG/4C+22AW6/2C No Bid $505.76 $500.00 $562.00

1000' Access Control wire

22AWG/3P+18AWG/4C+22AWG/4C+22AWG/2C No Bid $1,011.53 $1,000.00 $1,060.00

FP075-D8PE1M Enclosure No Bid $362.70 $500.00 $415.00

FP075-D8PE4M Enclosure No Bid $467.20 $627.00 $577.00

AL176ULXD 1.75 Amp 12/24v power supply No Bid $157.67 $203.00 $141.00

HID iCIass RWK400 Dual keypad reader No Bid $349.56 $488.00 $429.00

HID Signo Model 40K reader No Bid $332.44 $500.00 $444.00

OLS120 4.0 Amp 12/24v power supply No Bid $99.95 $131.00 $122.00

OLS 180 6.0 Amp 12/24v power supply No Bid $124.54 $164.00 $152.00

% Markup Above Bidders Actual Cost

(Dealer/Wholesale Cost) on parts and Materials No Bid 20% 30% 18%

Said eBid #2022-7-11282 Is located within the County Manager's Office.


