RESOLUTION 2021-07-12-05

BE IT RESOLVED, the Shelby County Commission hereby awards the bid for Road Sign and Traffic Safety
Material to the only responsive bidder, Vulcan Sign. Pricing varies by sign size and messaging as detailed in
the bid documents.

Said eBid 2021-6-11176 is located within the County Manager’s Office.



MUTCD REGULATORY SIGNS PRICE
R1-1:STOP
24X 24 19.53
30X 30 31.04
36 X 36 44 .66
48X 48 79.06
R1-2: YIELD
48 X 48 X 48 45.00
36 X 36X 36 24.60
30X30X30 16:71
R1-4 : ALL WAY
18X 6 5.22
R2-1: BLANK SPEED LIMIT
48 X 60 103.40
36 X 48 62.04
30X 36 38.78
24 X 30 25.85
18 X 24 15.51
R2-1-50
24X 30 25.85
R2-1-45
24 X 30 25.85
R2-1-40
24 X 30 25.85
R2-1-35
24 X 30 25.85
R2-1-30
24 X 30 25.85
R2-1-25
24 X 30 25.85
R2-1-25
24 X 30 25.85




MUTCD REGULATORY SIGNS PRICE

R2-1-20
24X 30 25.85
R2-5a REDUCED SPEED AHEAD (WORDS)
24 %X 30 25.85
R3-1: NO RIGHT TURN
30X 30 32.87
24 X 24 21.24
R3-1P: NO RIGHT TURN
24X 18 15.51
R3-2: NO LEFT TURN
30X 30 32.87
24 %24 21.24
R3-2P: NO LEFT TURN
24X18 15.51
R3-3: NO TURNS
36X 36 47.10
30X30 32.87
24X 24 21.24
R3-4: NO LEFT/U TURN
30X 30 32.87
24X 24 21.24
R3-4P: NO U TURN
24X 18 15.51
R3—5L: LEFT ARROW ONLY
30X 36 38.78
R3—5R: RIGHT ARROW ONLY
30X 36 38.78
R2-5a: REDUCE SPEED AHEAD (WORDS)

25.85

24 X 30




MUTCD REGULATORY SIGNS

PRICE

R2-5c: SPEED ZONE AHEAD

24 X 30 25.85
R3-7L: LEFT LANE MUST TURN LEFT
36X 36 46.53
30X 30 32.31
R3-7R: RIGHT LANE MUST TURN RIGHT
36 X 36 46.53
30X30 32.31
R3—9%a
30x36 38.78
24 x 30 25.85
R3—9b
24 x 36 31.02
R3—16
30x42 45.24
24 x 30 25.85
R3—17
30x42 45,24
24 x 30 25.85
R4-1: DO NOT PASS
24 X 30 25.85
18X 24 15.51
R4-2: PASS WITH CARE
24X 30 25.85
18X 24 15.51
R4-3: SLOWER TRAFFIC KEEP RIGHT
24 X 30 25.85
R4-5: TRUCKS USE RIGHT LANE

25.85

24 X 30




MUTCD REGULATORY SIGNS PRICE
R4-7:
24 %30 25.85
18 X 24 15.51
R4-7a KEEP RIGHT
24 X 30 25.85
R4-7P PLAQUE: KEEP RIGHT
24 X 18 15.51
R4-7Pa: KEEP RIGHT
24 x 30 25.85
18x 24 15.51
R4-7Pb: KEEP RIGHT
24 x 30 25,85
18 x 24 15.51
R4-8
24 x 30 25.85
18 x 24 15.51
R4-BP PLAQUE: KEEP LEFT
24X 18 15.51
R5-1: DO NOT ENTER
48 X 48 82.72
36X 36 46.53
30X 30 32.31
24X 24 20.68
R5-2: NO TRUCKS ( SYMBOL)
30X 30 32.87
24 X 24 21,24
R5-2P PLAQUE: NO TRUCKS
24X 18 15:51




MUTCD REGULATORY SIGNS PRICE
R6-1R: ONE WAY RIGHT
36X 12 15.51
R6-1L: ONE WAY LEFT
36X12 15.51
R6-2R: ONE WAY RIGHT
18X 24 15.51
R6-2L: ONE WAY LEFT
18X 24 15.51
R7-2 NO PARKING { SYMBOL) NO TIMES
18X 24 15.51
R8-3a NO PARKING
24X 24 20.68
R10-10L: LEFT TURN SIGNAL
24 X 30 26.41
R10-10R: RIGHT TURN SIGNAL
24 X 30 26.41
R10-11a: NO TURN ON RED
24X 30 26.41
18X 24 15.51
R10-11b: NO TURN ON RED
24 x 24 21.24
18 x 18 12.70
R10-12: LEFT TURN YIELD ON GREEN
24X 30 26.41
R12-1: BLANK WEIGHT LIMIT BLANK TONS
24 X 30 25.85
R12-2: AXLE WEIGHT LIMIT 5 TONS
24X 30 25.85




MUTCD REGULATORY SIGNS

PRICE

R12-5: BRIDGE WEIGHT LIMIT
(WEIGHTS OPTIONAL)

30X36

32.78

24X 30

25.85

R14-1: TRUCK ROUTE

24X18

15.51

CONSTRUCTION SIGNS

R11-2: ROAD CLOSED

48 X30

51.70

R11-3a: ROAD CLOSED ( *) MILES AHEAD LOCAL TRAFFIC ONLY
(NUMBER OPTIONAL)

60X30

64.63

R11-4: ROAD CLOSED TO THRU TRAFFIC

60 X 30

64.63

R12-5 AXLE WEIGHT LIMIT

60 x 30

64.63

R20-5a NO DUMPING

18X24

1551

§3-1A SCHOOL BUS STOP AHEAD ( SYMBOL)

GREEN / YELLOW FLOURESCENT

41.06

5-4-1 SCHOOL TIMES 7:15-8:30 / 2:15 — 3:30

24X 10

§4-3 SCHOOL FLOURESCENT YELLOW / GREEN

24 X8




CONSTRUCTION SIGNS PRICE
WB8-4 SOFT SHOULDER
36 X 36 46,53
W8-13 FALLING ROCK
36 X 36 46.53
W11-11a GOLF CART CROSSING
24 %24 20.68
W 13-1B SPEED ADV MPH BLANK
YELLOW PRECUT 1-0

BLANKS

W 14-8 FLOOD AREA AHEAD
36 X 36 46.53
W20-1a: ROAD WORK (1500 FT)
48 x 48 82.72
36 x 36 46.53
W20-1b ROAD WORK (1000 FT)
48 X 48 82.72
36 X36 46.53
W20-1c: ROAD WORK
48 X 48 82.72
36X 36 46.53
W20-1d ROAD WORK (AHEAD)
48 X 48 B2.72
36X 36 46.53
W20-2a: DETOUR (1500 FT)
48 X 48 82.72
36 X 36 46.53
W20-2b: DETOUR (1000 FT)
48 x 48 82.72
36x 36 46.53




MUTCD REGULATORY SIGNS

PRICE

W20-2c: DETOUR (500 FT)

48 x 48 82.72
36x36 46.53
W20-2d: DETOUR

48 x 48 82.72
36x 36 46.53
W20-3a: ROAD CLOSED (1500 FT)

48 x 48 82.72
36x36 46.53
W20-3b: ROAD CLOSED

48 x 48 82.72
36x36 46.53
W20-3c: ROAD CLOSED (500 FT)

A8 x 48 82.72
36 x 36 46.53
W20-3d: ROAD CLOSED (AHEAD)

48 X 48 82.72
36x36 46.53
W20-4a: ONE LANE ROAD (1500 FT)

48 x 48 82.72
36 x 36 46,53
W20-4b: ONE LANE ROAD

48 x 48 82.72
36 x 36 46.53
W20-4c: ONE LANE ROAD (500 FT)

48 x 48 B2.72
36x36 46.53
W20-4d: ONE LANE ROAD (AHEAD)

48 x 48 82.72
36x36 46.53




MUTCD REGULATORY SIGNS PRICE
W20-5d: RIGHT LANE CLOSED (1500 FT)
48 x 48 82.72
36 x 36 46.53
CONSTRUCTION SIGNS
W20-5b: RIGHT LANE CLOSED (1000 FT)
48 x 48 82.72
36x 36 46.53
W20-5¢: RIGHT LANE CLOSED (500 FT)
48 x 48 82.72
36x36 46.53
W20-5d: RIGHT LANE CLOSED
48 x 48 82.72
36 x 36 46.53
W20-7a: FLAGGER (1500 FT)
48 x 48 82.72
36 x 36 46.53
W20-7b: FLAGGER (1000 FT)
48 x 48 82.72
36x 36 46.53
W20-7c: FLAGGER ( 500 FT)
48 x 48 g82.72
36x36 46.53
W20-7d: FLAGGER
48 x 48 82.72
36x% 36 46.53
W20-7a: FLAGMAN SYMBOL
48 x 48 82.72
36x36 46.53
W21-1: WORKERS
48 x 48 B82.72
36 x 36 46.53




MUTCD REGULATORY SIGNS PRICE
W21-1a: WORKERS SYMBOL
48 X 48 82.72
36 X 36 46.53
W21-2: FRESH OIL
4B X 48 82.72
36 X 36 46.53
30X 30 32.31
W21-5; SHOULDER WORK
(DISTANCE CAN BE ADDED)
48 X 48 82.72
36X 36 46.53
30X 30 32.31
W21-6: SURVEY CREW
48 X 48 82.72
36X 36 46.53
30X 30 32.31
CONSTRUCTION SIGNS
W21-Sp: BE PREPARED TO STOP
48X 48 82.72
36X 36 46.53
30X 30 32.31
W41-2: BORDER ONLY
48 X 48 B2.72
36 X 36 46.53
30X 30 32.31
24X 24 20.68
M4-9R: DETOUR RIGHT ARROW
30X24 25.85
M4-9L: DETOUR LEFT ARROW
30X24 25.85
M4-10R: DETOUR RIGHT ARROW
48X 18 31.02




MUTCD REGULATORY SIGNS PRICE
M4-10L: DETOUR LEFT ARROW
48 X 18 31.02
G20-2: END ROAD WORK
60 X 24 51.70
48 X 24 41.36
GUIDE SIGNS

M1-4 - NUMBERS OPTIONAL US ROADS
36 X 36 (2 DIGIT) 46.53
45 X 36 (3 DIGIT) 58.16
30X 30 (2 DIGIT) 32.31
36 X 30 (3 DIGIT) 38.78
24 X 24 (2 DIGIT) 20.38
24 X 24 (31) 30.68
30X 24 (3 DIGIT) 25.85
30 X 24 (280) 25.85
M1-5-145
30x24 25.85
M1-5-119
30x24 25.85
M2-1 STATE JCT
21X15

11.87
M1-6 — COUNTY OPTIONAL

NUMBER OPTIONAL

36 X 36 54.54
30X30 37.79
24 X 24 26.84
18X 18 26.84




PRICE

GUIDE SIGNS
M2-1 COUNTY JCT
21X15 14,187
M2-1 STATE JCT
51 X 15 11.87
M3-1 COUNTY NORTH
24X 12 1586
30X 15 16.24
M3-1 COUNTY EAST
24%12 2290
30X 15 16.24
GUIDE SIGNS
M3-1 COUNTY SOUTH
24X 12 Eoaih
30X 15 15.24
M3-1 COUNTY WEST
24 X 12 10.86
30X 15 Lostn
M3-3 SOUTH COUNTY
24X18 1591
M3-4 WEST COUNTY
24%18 ool
M3-2 EAST COUNTY
2418 5.5
M3-1 NORTH STATE
54 X 18 15.51
M3-2 EAST STATE
24 X 18 15.51
M3-3 SOUTH STATE
24 X 18 15.51
V13-4 WEST STATE
24 X 18 15,51




GUIDE SIGNS PRICE
Ma4-5 COUNTY
24 x12 10.86
30x 15 16.24
M5-1 COUNTY
21x15 11.87
M6-1 COUNTY LEFT/RIGHT ARROWS
21X15 11.87
M6-1 STATE RIGHT /LEFT ARROW
21X15 11.87
M6-3 INT STRAIGHT UP ARROW CO.
21x 15 11.87
HAZARD / OBJECT MARKERS
MUTCD REGULATORY SIGNS PRICE

8 X 24 7.37
6X24 6.43
OM -2 3 BUTTON RELECTOR OM2-615YY
6X 15 3.80
OM-3-L/R LEFT / RIGHT ARROW
48 x 24 LEFT 41.36
48 x 24 RIGHT 41.36
OM -3 - CHAZARD BOARD

41.36

48X 24




SCHOOL SIGNS PRICE

$1-1 Fluorescent yellow green

36x36 56.41
30x 30 39.16
24 x 24 23.03
$3-1 SCHOOL BUS ENTERING HWY

36 x 36 47.10
30x30 32.87
54-1 ( Times Optional)

36x15 19.39
24x10 9.19
$4-3 School

36x12 19.79
24x8 B.84
5-5-2 END OF SCHOOL ZONE

24 X 30 25.85
5-5-2 SPEED ZONE AHEAD
24 X 30 25.85

$-6-25 SPEED LIMINT W/ SCHOOL TIME

24 X 48

44.80




MUTCD REGULATORY SIGNS PRICE
SCHOOL SIGNS
W9-11 ( Caution or Watch also)
18 x 24 15.51
W39-13 ( Caution or Watch also)
18 x 24 15,51
W9-14 ( Caution or Watch also)
( Number Optional)
18x 24 15.51
W39-15 Stop for Pedestrians
24 x 30 25.85
18x 24 15.51
WARNING SIGNS
W1-1R RIGHT TURN S0
36X 36 46.53
30X30 32.31
24X 24 20.68
W1-1L LEFT TURN 90
36 X 36 46.53
30 X 30 32.31
24 X 24 20.68
W1-2R RIGHT CURVE
36 X 36 46.53
30X 30 32.31
24 X 24 20.68
W1-2L LEFT CURVE
36 X 36 46.53
30X 30 32.31
24 X 24 20.68




MUTCD REGULATORY SIGNS PRICE
SCHOOL SIGNS
W1-3R RIGHT REVERSE TURN
36X36 46.53
30X30 32:.31
24 X 24 20.68
W1-3L LEFT REVERSE TURN
36X 36 46.53
30X 30 32.31
24 X24 20.68
W1-4R RIGHT REVERSE TURN
36X 36 46.53
30X 30 32.31
24X 24 20.68
W1-4R
36X 36 46,53
30X30 ad.ai
24 X 24 20.68
MUTCD REGULATORY SIGNS PRICE
WARNING SIGNS
W1-4L LEFT REVERSE CURVE
36 X 36 46.53
30X 30 32.31
24X 24 20.68
W1-5R RIGHT WINDING ROAD
36X 36 46.53
30X30 32.31
24X 24 20.68
W1-5L LEFT WINDING ROAD
36 X 36 46.53
30X 30 3230
24X 24 20.68




MUTCD REGULATORY SIGNS PRICE
W1-6 HAZARD BOARD ARROWS
48X 24 41.36
W1-6 HAZARD BOARD LEFT
48 X 24 41.36
W1-6 HAZARD BOARD RIGHT
48 X 24 41.36
W31-7 R HAZARD ARROW RIGHT
48 X 24 41.36
W1-7 LHAZARD ARROW LEFT
48 X 24 41.36
HAZARD BOARD CENTER
48X 24 41.36
W1-8 CHEVRON
24 X 30 25.85
18X 24 15.51
12X 18 8.01
wW2-1
36 X 36 46.53
30X 30 32.31
24 X 24 20.68
W2-2R
36X 36 46.53
30X30 32.31
24 X 24 20.68
W2-2R SIDE ROAD SYMBOL
36 X 36 46 .53
30X 30 32.31
24 X 24 20.68




MUTCD REGULATORY SIGNS PRICE
W2-3R
36 X 36 46 .53
30X 30 32.31
24 X 24 20.68
W2-3L
36X 36 46.53
30X 30 32.31
24X 24 20.68
W2-4 T INTERSECTION
36X36 46.53
30X 30 32.31
24X 24 20.68
MUTCD REGULATORY SIGNS PRICE
WARNING SIGNS
W2-5
36X 36 46.53
30X 30 32.31
24 X 24 20.68
W3-1
36X36 47.66
30X 30 33.43
W3-1a
36x36 47.66
30x 30 33.43
W3-2
36 x 36 47.66
30x30 33.43
W3-2a
36x36 47.66
30x30 33.43




MUTCD REGULATORY SIGNS PRICE
WARNING SIGNS

w3-3
36X 36 48.21
30X 30 33.99
W3-3a
36 x36 48.21
30x30 33.99
W3-5 (Mod-School)
36x36 47.10
30x30 32.87
W4-1R
36 X 36 46.53
30X 30 32.31
24 X 24 20.68
wWa4-1L
36 X 36 46.53
30X 30 33,531
24 X24 20.68
W4-2R
36X 36 46.53
30X30 34231
Wa4-2L
36 X 36 46.53
30X 30 32.31
w4-3
48 X 48 82.72
W5-1
36X 36 46.53
30X30 32.31




MUTCD REGULATORY SIGNS PRICE
WARNING SIGNS

W5-2

36 X 36 46.53
30X 30 32.31
24 %24 20.68
W5-3

36X 36 46.53
30X30 32.31
W6-1

36 X 36 46.53
30X 30 32.31
We6-1a

36x36 46.53
30x30 32.31
W6-2

36X 36 46.53
30X 30 32.31
W6-2A

36 X 36 46.53
30X30 32.31
W6-3

36 X 36 46.53
30X 30 32.31
24 X 24 20.68
W7-1

36X 36 46.53
30 X30 32.31
24X 24 20.68
W7-1a

36X 36 46.53
30X 30 32.31
24X 24 20.68




MUTCD REGULATORY SIGNS PRICE
WARNING SIGNS

W7-1b
36 x 36 46.53
30x 30 32.31
24x24 20.68
wWs-1
36 X 36 46.53
30X 30 3231
24X24 20.68
W8-2
36X 36 46.53
30X 30 32.31
24X 24 20.68
W8-3
36 X36 46.53
30X 30 32.31
24 X24 20.68
W8-4
36X 36 46.53
30X 30 32.31
24X 24 20.68
W8-5
36X36 46.53
30X 30 32.31
24X 24 20.68
W8-6
36 X 36 46.53
30X 30 32.31
24X 24 20.68




MUTCD REGULATORY SIGNS PRICE
WARNING SIGNS

W8-7
36 X 36 46.53
30X 30 32.31
24 X 24 20.68
W8-8
36 X36 46.53
30X 30 32.31
24 X 24 20.68
W8-9
36 X36 46.53
30X30 32.31
24 %24 20.68
W8-9a
36 x36 46.53
30x 30 32.31
24 x24 20.68
WS-1R
36 X36 46.53
30X 30 32.31
W9-1L
36 X36 46.53
30X30 32.31
W9-2R
36 X36 46.53
30X 30 32.31
W9-2L
36X 36 46.53
30X30 32.31




MUTCD REGULATORY SIGNS PRICE
WARNING SIGNS

Wi10-1

36 DIAMETER 42.60
30 DIAMETER 30.63
W10-2R

36 X 36 46.53
30X 30 32.31
24X 24 20.68
W10-2L

36 X 36 46.53
30X 30 32.31
24 X 24 20.68
W10-3R

36 X 36 46.53
30X 30 359,31
24X 24 20.68
W10-3L

36 X36 46.53
30X 30 32.31
24X 24 20.68
W10-4R

36X 36 46.53
30X 30 32.31
24X 24 20.68
W10-4L

36 X 36 46.53
30X 30 32.31
24 X 24 20.68
wWii-1

36 X 36 46.53
30X 30 32.31
24X 24 20.68




MUTCD REGULATORY SIGNS PRICE
WARNING SIGNS

Wi11-2

36 X 36 46.53
30X 30 32.31
24 X 24 20.68
W11A-2P

24 X 18 15.51
Wi1-3

36 X 36 46.53
30X30 32,31
24 X 24 20.68
wWi1-4

36 X 36 46.53
30X 30 32.31
24X 24 20.68
Wi11-5

36X 36 46.53
30X30 32.31
24 X24 20.68
Wi1-6

36X36 46.53
30X30 32.31
24X 24 20.68
Wi11-7

36X 36 46.53
30X 03 32.31
24X 24 20.68
Wi11-8

36 X36 46.53
30X30 32.31




MUTCD REGULATORY SIGNS PRICE
WARNING SIGNS

Wi11-9
36X 36 46 .53
30X30 32.31
W11-10
36X36 46.53
30X 30 32.31
W12-1 (NUMBER OPTIONAL)
36 X 36 46.53
30X 30 32.31
W13-1 (NUMBER OPTIONAL)
24 X 24 20.68
18X 18 1216
wWi4-1
36 X 36 46.53
30X 30 32.31
24 X 24
W14-2
36 X 36 46.53
30X 30 32.31
24X 24 20.68
wW1i4-3
36 X 48 X 48 35.141
Wi15-1
36X 36 46.53
30X 30 32.31
W15-5P
30X30 32.31
24X 24 20.68




MUTCD REGULATORY SIGNS PRICE
WARNING SIGNS

W16-1
36X36 46.53
30X 30 32.31
24 X 24 20.68
W41-1 BORDER ONLY
36X 36 46.53
30X30 32.31
24 X 24 20.68
w42-1
36 X 36 46.53
30X 30 32.31
24 X 24 20.68
waz-7
36X 36 46.53
30X 30 32.31
24 X 24 20.68
W42-8
36X 36 46.53
30X 30 32.31
24X 24 20.68
CV-9 THANK YOU FOR NOT LITTERING
18X 24 20.84
DQ-6 HANDICAP SYMBOL
24 x24 21.24
SLOW MOVING VEHICLE
14 X 16 12.50
ROUGH SURFACE
36 X 36 32.31




SPEED LIMIT 45 AHEAD ( SYMBOL)

PRICE

36X36 46.53
SPEED LIMIT 40 AHEAD ( SYMBOL)
36 X 36 46.53
NW-1 WARNING NEIGHBORHOOD WATCH
18 X 24 20.84
NW-11 CRIME WATCH
18X 24 20.84
STOP/SLOW PADDLES
18 28.45
24 42.02
BARRICADES plastic
TYPEI 75.50
24 X8
MUTCD REGULATORY SIGNS PRICE
24 X12 78.81
36X8 NO BID
36X12 NO BID
TYPEII
24X 8 82.13
24X 12 88.09
36X8 NO BID
36X 12 NO BID




MUTCD REGULATORY SIGNS PRICE
TYPE Il
48X 8 89.76
72X 8 120.16
96X 8 149.83
96 X 10 NO BID
96 X 12 NO BID
A-FRAME 144 .30
STANDARD TRAFFIC CONES WITH COLLARS

LIME GREEN
121518 no BIDPRICE
183 LB 14.50
2855LB NO BID
287 LB 17.55
28 10LB NO BID
3610 LB NO BID
ORANGE
12 1.5LB 12.50
18318 12.50
285.5LB 15.50
28718 17.55
2810LB 19.55
36 1-LB 29.12
ALSO IN FLOURESCENT GREEN NO BID
STABILIZERS
FOR 36 “ CONE NO BID
TRAFFIC DRUM
TYPE I 85.66

*ALL TRAFFIC CONES MUST BE BOUGHT

IN BUNDLES OF 50




SHEETING AND CLEAR TAPE

PRICE

Sheeting, 6"x50 yard roll on 3” diameter core, pressure sensitive, ALL

available colors (except Fluorescent) 93.75
Sheeting, 9"x50 yard roll on 3" diameter core, pressure sensitive, ALL
available colors (except Fluorescent) 140.63
Sheeting, 12"x50 yard roll on 3” diameter core, pressure sensitive, ALL
available colors (except Fluorescent) 151.25
Sheeting, 18”x50 yard roll on 3" diameter core, pressure sensitive, ALL
available colors (except
281.25
Fluorescent)
Sheeting, 24x50 yard roll on 3” diameter core, pressure sensitive, ALL
available colors (except Fluorescent) 375.00
SHEETING AND CONSPICUITY TAPE
Sheeting, 30"x50 yard roll on 3” diameter core, pressure sensitive, ALL
available colors (except Fluorescent) 468.75
Sheeting, 36”x50 yard roll on 3" diameter core, pressure sensitive, ALL
available colors (except Fluorescent) 562.50
HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC PRICE
(HIP) REFLECTIVE SHEETING 48 X 25
WHITE NO BID
HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC PRICE
(HIP) REFLECTIVE SHEETING 48 X 50
WHITE 750.00
YELLOW 750.00
RED 750.00

PER ROLL



HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC

PRICE
(HIP) REFLECTIVE SHEETING 48 X 50
ORANGE 750.00
BLUE 750.00
GREEN 750.00
BROWN 750.00
DIAMOND GRADE FLOURESCENT TELED
WORK ZONE SHEETING 24 x 50 :
FLOURESCENT ORANGE 24 x 50 675.00
DIAMOND GRADE VIP
REFLECTIVE SHEETING 24 x 50¥D
WHITE 675.00
YELLOW 675.00
RED 675.00
BLUE 675.00
GREEN 675.00
FLOURESCENT YELLOW 675.00
FLOURESCENT YELLOW-GREEN 675.00
Low Tack Application Tape 6”"x100 AE_ 05
APPLICATION TAPE CLEAR -36 X 100
AT60 TAPE CLEAR CHOICE i




ROLL-UP SIGNS & STANDS - various words PRICE
36 32.55
RIBS
36 15.75
Sign Stand for rollup mesh signs
Universal Bracket for rollup sign stand 193.03
SIGN POSTS PRICE

Sign Post -Green Painted -2. Ib. - 12 Ft. SEL 53
Sign Post - Green Painted - 2. |b. - 10 Ft.

21.10
Sign Post - Green Painted - 2. |b. - 8 Ft. o, B
Sign Post Black Painted powder2. Ib. 12 Ft. 55
Sign Post Black Painted powder2. Ib. 10 Ft. 55 3%
Sign Post Black Painted powder2. |b. 8 Ft. —
Sign Post - Galvanized - 3.0 |b. - 14 Ft. 5 a
Sign Post - Galvanized - 3.0 |b./Ft. - 12 Ft.

46.68
Sign Post - Galvanized - 3.0 |b./Ft. - 10 Ft.

38.90
Sign Post - Galvanized - 3.0 |b./Ft. - 8 Ft.

31.12
Delineator Post - 1.12 |b./Ft. - 6ft. 4.5
Cross Bracket, for flat blade signs, 5 1/2" blade holder, w/ cadmium plated
set screws 5.15

*U-CHANNEL POSTS MUST BE BOUGHT IN BUNDLES OF 50

*1.12LB POSTS MUST BE BOUGHT IN BUNDLES OF 100

*BLACK POWDER COATED POSTS MUST BE BOUGNT IN BUNDLES OF 100




SIGN POSTS PRICE
Caps for U-Channel posts, street name sign parallel with U-channel mounting
surface for flat blade signs, 5 1/2" blade holder with cadmium plated set
SCrews iR
Caps for U-Channel posts, street name sign perpendicular to U-channel
mounting surface for flat blade signs, 5 1/2" blade holder with cadmium g
plated set screws )
5052-H38 SPECS - SHEET ALUMINUM AND PRE-CUT ALUMINUM SIGN PRICE
BLANKS
Aluminum Diamond/Square, 0.080 gauge $3.37/5QF
Aluminum Rectangular, 0.080 gauge
$3.37/SQF
Aluminum Circle, 0.080 gauge
$3.92/SQF
Aluminum Octagon, 0.080 Gauge
$3.64/SQF

Extruded Street name sign with green sheeting ON BOTH SIDES, no message,
9" wide, various lengths to be specified at time of order

10.00 PER SQ FT

5052-H38 SPECS - SHEET ALUMINUM AND PRE-CUT ALUMINUM SIGN
BLANKS

PRICE

Extruded Street name sign with green sheeting ON BOTH SIDES, street
name, white 6 % " letters ON BOTH SIDES, 9" wide, various lengths to be
specified at time of order

15.74 PER SQ FT

Extruded Street name sign with green sheeting ON BOTH SIDES, no message,
6% " wide, various lengths to be specified at time of order

9.44 PER SQ FT




THE UNDERSIGNED OFFERS THESE PRICES, TERMS, AND DELIVERY AS PER BID SPECIFICATIONS:

NAME OF COMPANY: Vulcan Inc., dba Vulcan Aluminum dba Vulcan Signs
SIGNATURE: @E% ~
ADDRESS: PO BOX 1850 Fol;’?

U

TELEPHONE: 800-633-6845

BID BOND: (If Applicable)

Sworn to and subscribed before me this the 24th dayof June 2021

My Commission Expires: _2/25/2023
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