RESOLUTION 2025-06-23-03

BE IT RESOLVED, that the Shelby County Commission hereby awards the bid for Restroom Supply Products to the
lowest responsive bidder for each item as highlighted below. The awarded vendors are Budget Janitorial Supply and
Strickland Paper Co., Inc.

% Off Below

Tork . Foaming :
Morcon Single Roll Paper Scott Multi Antibacterial R_etall of
M29 Bath fold ) List Cost
BIDDER Tissue/case Bath Towels/case Towels/case Skin Other
(12 rolls) Tissue (6 rolls) 4.000 Cleanser Catalo
(96 rolls) (4.000ea) | (g eaach) ata0g
tems
American
Osment - $19.50 $39.25 $30.95 $23.25 No Bid 25%
Imperial Dade
Budget
Janitorial $18.25 $33.50 $24.90 $20.50 $56.00 30%
Central Paper | 19,95 $40.65 $25.30 No Bid No Bid 25%
Central Poly- | ¢31 00 $54.00 $34.00 $32.00 No Bid 0%
Bag Corp. ' ' ' '
Strickland 0
Companies $31.93 $36.42 $29.55 $23.86 $99.50 40%

Said eBid #2025-5-11582 is located within the office of the Chief Financial Officer.




