RESOLUTION 2025-06-23-05

BE IT RESOLVED, the Shelby County Commission hereby awards the bid for Less Lethal Weapons —
Launchers and Ammunition to the lowest responsive bidder for each group as highlighted below. The

awarded bidders are Gulf States Distributors, Inc. and Proforce Law Enforcement.

FN303 Launcher

FN303 Clear Impact

FN303 Indelible Paint rounds
FN303 Inert Powder rounds
FN303 Washable Paint rounds
FN303 PAVA/OC Powder

40MM Launcher

Direct Impact 40mm training rounds
BExact Impact 40 mmstandard range
Stinger 60 caliber 40 mm rounds

First Defence OC Vapor

CS gas grenade

Stingball grenade

Low Roll Il Distraction Device HH

Dana GT Distributors Gulf States Proforce
$ 185000 $ 1,875.00 $ 1,850.00 $ 1,813.19
$ 389.00 $ 41177 % 41500 $ 384.62
$ 389.00 $ 41177 % 41500 $ 384.62
$ 389.00 $ 41177 % 41500 $ 384.62
$ 389.00 $ 41177 % 41500 $ 384.62
$ 533.00 $ 56471 $ 569.00 $ 527.47
$ 393900 $ 4086.79 $ 4,079.00 $ 3,879.14
NO BID $ 1,300.00 $ 1,295.00 NO BID
NO BID $ 1,530.30 $ 1,499.00 NO BID
NO BID $ 2659 $ 30.00 NO BID
NO BID $ 2924 $ 33.00 NO BID
$ 2,886.13 $ 2,857.00
NO BID $ 6595 $ 69.00 NO BID
NO BID $ 3265 $ 33.00 NO BID
NO BID $ 7077 $ 70.00 NO BID
NO BID $ 96.30 $ 92.00 NO BID
$ 265.67 $ 264.00

Said eBid #2025-4-11577 is located in the office of the county’s Chief Financial Officer.



