
RESOLUTION 2024-05-13-04 

BE IT RESOLVED, the Shelby County Commission hereby awards the bid for Reflective Safety 

Apparel Class III to the overall lowest responsive bidder Southern Nameplate & Graphics as shown 

below:  

ANSI/ASEA 107 HIGH-VISIBILITY SAFETY APPAREL 

  
BREWER & ASSOCIATES, 

LLC 
SOUTHERN NAMEPLATE & 

GRAPHICS 

VEA 104 CT-/LM-204 CT/LM--LIME SHIRT WITH 
LOGO COST PER SHIRT COST PER SHIRT 

104 CT-REGULAR SHORT SLEEVE--SMALL 27.00 23.00 

104 CT-REGULAR SHORT SLEEVE--MEDIUM 27.00 23.00 

104 CT-REGULAR SHORT SLEEVE--LARGE 27.00 23.00 

104 CT-REGULAR SHORT SLEEVE--X-LARGE 27.00 23.00 

104 CT-REGULAR SHORT SLEEVE--2X-LARGE 27.00 23.00 

104 CT-REGULAR SHORT SLEEVE--3X-LARGE 30.00 25.00 

104 CT-REGULAR SHORT SLEEVE--LARGE TALL 30.00 25.00 

104 CT-REGULAR SHORT SLEEVE--X-LARGE TALL 30.00 25.00 

104 CT-REGULAR SHORT SLEEVE--2X-LARGE TALL 30.00 25.00 

104 CT-REGULAR SHORT SLEEVE--3X-LARGE TALL 30.00 25.00 

204 CT-REGULART LONG SLEEVE--SMALL 31.50 31.00 

204 CT-REGULART LONG SLEEVE--MEDIUM 31.50 31.00 

204 CT-REGULART LONG SLEEVE--LARGE 31.50 31.00 

204 CT-REGULART LONG SLEEVE--X-LARGE 31.50 31.00 

204 CT-REGULART LONG SLEEVE--2X-LARGE 31.50 31.00 

204 CT-REGULART LONG SLEEVE--3X LARGE 34.00 33.00 

204 CT-REGULART LONG SLEEVE--LARGE TALL 34.00 33.00 

204 CT-REGULART LONG SLEEVE--X-LARGE TALL 34.00 33.00 

204 CT-REGULART LONG SLEEVE--2X LARGE TALL 34.00 33.00 

204 CT-REGULART LONG SLEEVE--3X LARGE TALL 34.00 33.00 

REFLECT 50 SHORT SLEEVE BUTTON-UP--SMALL NO BID NO BID 

REFLECT 50 SHORT SLEEVE BUTTON-UP--MEDIUM NO BID NO BID 

REFLECT 50 SHORT SLEEVE BUTTON-UP--LARGE NO BID NO BID 

REFLECT 50 SHORT SLEEVE BUTTON-UP--X-LARGE NO BID NO BID 

REFLECT 50 SHORT SLEEVE BUTTON-UP--2X LARGE NO BID NO BID 

REFLECT 50 SHORT SLEEVE BUTTON-UP--3X LARGE NO BID NO BID 

REFLECT 50 SHORT SLEEVE BUTTON-UP--LARGE TALL NO BID NO BID 

REFLECT 50 SHORT SLEEVE BUTTON-UP--X-LARGE 
TALL NO BID NO BID 

REFLECT 50 SHORT SLEEVE BUTTON-UP--2X LARGE 
TALL NO BID NO BID 

REFLECT 50 SHORT SLEEVE BUTTON-UP--3X LARGE 
TALL NO BID NO BID 



  
BREWER & ASSOCIATES, 

LLC 
SOUTHERN NAMEPLATE & 

GRAPHICS 

JACKET WITH LOGO COST PER JACKET COST PER JACKET 

413GTLB GT BOMBER JACKET--SMALL 54.00 47.00 

413GTLB GT BOMBER JACKET--MEDIUM 54.00 47.00 

413GTLB GT BOMBER JACKET--LARGE 54.00 47.00 

413GTLB GT BOMBER JACKET--X-LARGE 54.00 47.00 

413GTLB GT BOMBER JACKET--2X-LARGE 54.00 47.00 

413GTLB GT BOMBER JACKET--3X-LARGE 59.50 51.00 

413GTLB GT BOMBER JACKET--X-LARGE TALL 57.00 50.00 

413GTLB GT BOMBER JACKET--2X-LARGE TALL 57.00 50.00 

413GTLB GT BOMBER JACKET--3X-LARGE TALL 57.00 50.00 

403ETLB T RAIN JACKET--SMALL 37.00 34.00 

403ETLB T RAIN JACKET--MEDIUM 37.00 34.00 

403ETLB T RAIN JACKET--LARGE 37.00 34.00 

403ETLB T RAIN JACKET--X-LARGE 37.00 34.00 

403ETLB T RAIN JACKET--2X-LARGE 37.00 34.00 

403ETLB T RAIN JACKET--3X-LARGE 43.00 38.00 

403ETLB T RAIN JACKET--X-LARGE TALL NO BID NO BID 

403ETLB T RAIN JACKET--2X-LARGE TALL NO BID NO BID 

403ETLB T RAIN JACKET--3X-LARGE TALL NO BID NO BID 

431STLB ST PARKA--SMALL 72.00 63.00 

431STLB ST PARKA--MEDIUM 72.00 63.00 

431STLB ST PARKA--LARGE 72.00 63.00 

431STLB ST PARKA--X-LARGE 72.00 63.00 

431STLB ST PARKA--2X-LARGE 72.00 63.00 

431STLB ST PARKA--3X-LARGE 76.00 67.00 

431STLB ST PARKA--X-LARGE TALL NO BID NO BID 

431STLB ST PARKA--2X-LARGE TALL NO BID NO BID 

431STLB ST PARKA--3X LARGE TALL NO BID NO BID 

602STLB STLB ZIPPER SWEATSHIRT--SMALL 53.00 46.00 

602STLB STLB ZIPPER SWEATSHIRT--MEDIUM 53.00 46.00 

602STLB STLB ZIPPER SWEATSHIRT--LARGE 53.00 46.00 

602STLB STLB ZIPPER SWEATSHIRT--X-LARGE 53.00 46.00 

602STLB STLB ZIPPER SWEATSHIRT--2X-LARGE 53.00 46.00 

602STLB STLB ZIPPER SWEATSHIRT--3X-LARGE 59.00 51.00 

602STLB STLB ZIPPER SWEATSHIRT--X-LARGE TALL 56.00 48.00 

602STLB STLB ZIPPER SWEATSHIRT--2X-LARGE TALL 56.00 48.00 

602STLB STLB ZIPPER SWEATSHIRT--3X-LARGE TALL 62.00 53.00 

605GTLN GTLN 1/4 ZIP SWEATSHIRT--SMALL 42.00 38.00 

605GTLN GTLN 1/4 ZIP SWEATSHIRT--MEDIUM 42.00 38.00 

605GTLN GTLN 1/4 ZIP SWEATSHIRT--LARGE 42.00 38.00 



605GTLN GTLN 1/4 ZIP SWEATSHIRT--X-LARGE 42.00 38.00 

605GTLN GTLN 1/4 ZIP SWEATSHIRT--2X-LARGE 42.00 38.00 

605GTLN GTLN 1/4 ZIP SWEATSHIRT--3X-LARGE 48.00 42.00 

605GTLN GTLN 1/4 ZIP SWEATSHIRT--X-LARGE TALL NO BID NO BID 

605GTLN GTLN 1/4 ZIP SWEATSHIRT--2X-LARGE TALL NO BID NO BID 

605GTLN GTLN 1/4 ZIP SWEATSHIRT--3X-LARGE TALL NO BID NO BID 

604GTLN GTLN HOODIE SWEATSHIRT--SMALL 41.00 38.00 

604GTLN GTLN HOODIE SWEATSHIRT--MEDIUM 41.00 38.00 

604GTLN GTLN HOODIE SWEATSHIRT--LARGE 41.00 38.00 

604GTLN GTLN HOODIE SWEATSHIRT--X-LARGE 41.00 38.00 

604GTLN GTLN HOODIE SWEATSHIRT--2X-LARGE 41.00 38.00 

604GTLN GTLN HOODIE SWEATSHIRT--3X-LARGE 48.00 42.00 

604GTLN GTLN HOODIE SWEATSHIRT--X-LARGE TALL NO BID NO BID 

604GTLN GTLN HOODIE SWEATSHIRT--2X-LARGE TALL NO BID NO BID 

604GTLN GTLN HOODIE SWEATSHIRT--3X-LARGE TALL NO BID NO BID 

  
BREWER & ASSOCIATES, 

LLC 
SOUTHERN NAMEPLATE & 

GRAPHICS 

VEST WITH LOGO COST PER VEST COST PER VEST 

583 ETLM ECONOMY VEST--SMALL 14.00 15.00 

583 ETLM ECONOMY VEST--MEDIUM 14.00 15.00 

583 ETLM ECONOMY VEST--LARGE 14.00 15.00 

583 ETLM ECONOMY VEST--X-LARGE 14.00 15.00 

583 ETLM ECONOMY VEST--2X-LARGE 14.00 15.00 

583 ETLM ECONOMY VEST--3X-LARGE 17.00 17.00 

589 ETLM SURVEYOR VEST--SMALL 18.00 18.00 

590 ETLM SURVEYOR VEST--MEDIUM 18.00 18.00 

591 ETLM SURVEYOR VEST--LARGE 18.00 18.00 

592 ETLM SURVEYOR VEST--X-LARGE 18.00 18.00 

593 ETLM SURVEYOR VEST--2X-LARGE 18.00 18.00 

594 ETLM SURVEYOR VEST--3X-LARGE 21.00 20.00 

  
BREWER & ASSOCIATES, 

LLC 
SOUTHERN NAMEPLATE & 

GRAPHICS 

ACCESSORIES WITH LOGO COST  PER ACCESSORY COST  PER ACCESSORY 

804STLM RANGER HAT--FITS MOST LM 16.25 16.00 

804STLM RANGER HAT--JUMBO LM NO BID NO BID 

803STLM BASEBALL CAP--FITS MOST LM 13.00 17.00 

803STLM BASEBALL CAP--JUMBO LM NO BID NO BID 

799STLM LEG GAITERS--FITS MOST LM 13.75 21.00 

799STLM LEG GAITERS--JUMBO LM NO BID NO BID 

 

Said eBid #2025-4-11572 is located in the office of the Chief Financial Officer. 


