RESOLUTION 2025-01-27-06

BE IT RESOLVED, that the Shelby County Commission hereby awards the bid for Copper Tubing and
PVC Pipe to the overall low bidder, Empire Pipe and Supply as attached.

Said eBid #2025-1-11536 is located within the office of the Chief Financial Officer.



SUMMARY

COPPER TUBING - PVC PIPE FERGUSON | EMPIREPIPE | . oo\ e
BID JANUARY 16, 2025 WATERWORKS | AND SUPPLY SUPPLY
Estimated o
Bid Items Annual e onded Total |Extended Total |Extended Total |Extended Total
Quantity
Needed

%" Type K Soft
Copper Tubing (60" or | 1,500 $ 7,155.00| $ 7,545.00| $ 10,275.00| $ 9,270.00
100’ Coils), per foot
1” Type K Soft Copper
Tubing (60’ or 100’ 3,000 |s 19,050.00 | $ 20,010.00| $ 27,450.00| $ 24,660.00
Coils), per foot
2" Type K Soft Copper
Tubing (60’ or 100’ 300 $ 6,102.00| $ 5718.00| $ 6,885.00| $ 6,027.00
Coils), per foot
2" PVC Pipe, 250 psi,
DR17, IPS, Slip Joint, 500 $ 725.00| $ 710.00 NO BID $ 700.00
per foot
3" PVC Pipe, 250 psi,
DR17, IPS, Slip Joint, 300 $ 915.00| $ 891.00 NO BID $ 834.00
per foot
4" PVC Pipe, 250 psi,
DR17, IPS, Slip Joint, 500 $ 2,515.00| $ 2,295.00 NO BID $ 2,320.00
per foot
6" PVC Pipe, 250 psi,
DR17, IPS, Slip Joint, 500 $ 544000 $ 5,150.00 NO BID $ 4,890.00
per foot
8" PVC Pipe, 250 psi,
DR17, IPS, Slip Joint, 100 $ 1,853.00| $ 1,682.00 NO BID $ 1,642.00
per foot
10” PVC Pipe, 250
psi, DR17, IPS, Slip 100 $ 3,078.00| $ 2,603.00 NO BID $ 2,548.00
Joint, per foot

TOTALS| $ 46,833.00 | $ 46,604.00| $ 44,610.00| $ 52,891.00

EMPIRE PIPE AND | Non-responsive -
SUPPLY No PVC bid

COPPER AND TUBING BID SUMMARY OCTOBER 2023




