RESOLUTION 2025-02-10-06

BE IT RESOLVED, that the Shelby County Commission hereby awards the bid for Stone to be
delivered to the lowest responsive bidder per item as highlighted below. The awarded vendors are Dunn
Construction and Vulcan Materials Company.

STONE—DELIVERY

Vendor Vendor
B Dunn Construction | Vulcan Materials Co.
Iltem No. Size & Specification Bid Price--Ton Bid Price--Ton
- 1. Class 1 10-1004 RIPRAP 7 32.00 42,60 |
B 2, Class 2 10-200% RIPRAP 3200 42,60
3. | Class325-5008 RIPRAP NOBID| 4910
4. Class 4 50-1000# RIPRAP ~ NOBID|, 5210
5. 6” — 3" GABION STONE N NO BID 42.60
6. A H D #1 STONE 25.00 33.85
7. A H D #1 MODIFIED STONE 2500/ @ NOBID |
8 A H D #2 STONE NO BID 33.85
|9 A H D #3 STONE NO BID 33.85
10. A H D #4 STONE N 25.00 33.85
11. A H D #5 STONE NO BID 39.60
12. AHD#6STONE NO BID 39.60
13. A H D #7 STONE NO BID 3960
14. A H D #23 STONE ) NO BID NO BID
| 1S AHD#57STONE | 25.00 33.85
16. A H D #67 STONE 25.00 33.85
1. AHD#78STONE 26.00 35.10
| 18. A H D #78 WASHED STONE B - 26.00 35.10
19. | AHD#B910STONE 22.00 31.35
_ 20. 825 A Dense Grade Base “NOBID| S
21. 825 B-11/2" #410 Crusher Run 22.00 31.35
22. 825 B— (PUG MILL MIXED) 1 1/2# 22.00 31.35
23. Surge ~ NOBID| 4010
24, Miscellaneous Scrap Waste Stone 20.00 NO BID
325 Stripping Material NO BID NO BID

Said eBid # 2025-1-11542 is located within the office of the Chief Financial Officer.



