RESOLUTION 2024-12-23-06

BE IT RESOLVED, that the Shelby County Commission hereby awards the bid for Restroom
Supply Products to the lowest responsive bidder for each item as highlighted below. The awarded
vendors are Aasdel Corporation, Budget Janitorial Supply, Strickland Companies, and United
Sales USA Corp.

A bid received from One Source for foaming hand cleanser was considered non-responsive as the
item they offered was not antibacterial as requested in the specifications.

- o -
Morcon M29| Tork Single Scott Multi- | Foaming | % Off Below
Paper Antibacterial | Retail or List
Bath Roll Bath i fold . _
. . Towels/case Skin Cost Other
Tissue/case | Tissue (96 Towels/case | )
12 rolls) rolls) (6 rolls) (4,000 ea.) Cleanser (6 Catalog
BIDDER (12 rolk ' * ) each) Tiems
11400, Inc. 528.04 $65.44 $53.89 547.29 No Bid 20%
A i O: t-
merican Smen $20.45 $40.00 $30.95 $25.50 No Bid 25%
Imperial Dade
Aasdel Corporation £24.50 No Bid $20.50 $45.00 No Bid No Bid
Budget Janitorial $18.70 $35.50 52498 $21.30 §56.00 30%
Central Paper Co. $19.95 $41.50 $25.30 No Bid No Bid 2504
e R _ Non- _
One Source §25.55 $65.75 $31.25 $46.60 . 35%
Responsive
Pacific 5t
aere = $48.90 $79.98 $57.31 $50.45 $99.75 20%
Corporation
Strickland
. Hie ﬂ!l $30.22 $34.90 52095 52304 562.29 37%
Companies
United Sales USA =
e c-uﬂr:g $18.53 $35.98 $24.00 $20.93 $57.49 40%

Said eBid #2024-11-11525 is located within the office of the Chief Financial Officer.



