RESOLUTION 2024-11-13-08
BE IT RESOLVED, the Shelby County Commission hereby awards the bid for Inmate Hygiene Products
to the lowest responsive bidder for each item as attached. The awarded bidders are Bob Barker Company,

Inc., Engaged Healthcare Solutions, LLC., ICS Jail Supplies, Inc., and Mid-States Services, Inc.

Said eBid #2024-10-11517 is located in the office of the county’s Chief Financial Officer.



Bob Barker Engaged Healthcare ICS Mid-States

2 oz Clear liquid Shave, Shower and

Shampoo $21.50/96 $0.22 $28.70/96 $0.30 $35.33/96 $0.37 $22.80/96 $0.24
2 oz Clear liquid Shave, Shower and

Shampoo (animal fat-free option) $21.50/96 $0.22 NO BID NO BID $35.33/96 $0.37 NO BID NO BID
Shampoo $22.50/60 $0.38 $27.50/60 $0.46 $36.59/60 $0.61 $22.50/60 $0.38
4 oz Clear liquid Shave, Shower and

Shampoo (animal fat-free option) $22.50/60 $0.38 NO BID NO BID $36.59/60 50.61 NO BID NO BID
|Bar Soap $47.50/500 $0.10 $36.00/250 $0.14 $73.62/500 $0.15 $50.00/500 $0.10
Toothbrush $5.25/144 $0.04 $81.50/1440 $0.06 $81.59/1440 $0.06 $54.35/1440 $0.04
Clear Toothpaste $38.95/144 $0.27 $38.65/144 $0.27 540.69/144 $0.28 $29.42/144 50.20
option) $38.95/144 $0.27 NO BID NO BID $40.69/144 $0.28 NO BID NO BID
Sanitary Napkins $34.50/576 $0.06 NO BID NO BID $50.57/576 50.09 $18.75/250 $0.08
Lice Control Shampoo - 1 gallon w/
|pump $55.00/1 $55.00 NO BID NO BID $224.48/4 $56.12 $38.00/1 $38.00
lLice Control Shampoo - 2 oz NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $147.52/12 (402) $12.29 NO BID NO BID
|Lice control Aerosol Spray $91.95/12 $7.66 NO BID NO BID $85.46/12 $7.12 NO BID NO BID
Wabil Senlar Professional Hak Clippers $90.00/1 $90.00 NO BID NO BID $86.25/1 $86.25 NO BID NO BID
Wahl Senior Professional Clipper

Replacement Blade Set $14.83/1 $14.83 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Fingernail Clippers $8.20/24 50.34 $60.95/288 $0.21 $85.00/288 $0.30 $30.60/144 $0.21
Toenail Clippers $7.15/12 $0.60 $70.60/144 $0.49 $82.00/144 $0.57 $66.60/144 50.46
Concentrated Barbicide Disinfectant 64

02 $97.00/6 $16.17 NO BID NO BID $36.28/1 $36.28 NO BID NO BID
— $130.40/2000 -

$82.25/500 $0.16 $180.00/2000 $.07 $.09 $66.76/1000 $0.07 $56.00/1000 $0.06

Shaving Cream $23.50/12 $1.96 $14.25/12 $1.19 $21.12/12 $1.76 $13.20/12 $1.10
Sani Fresh Eurobath $68.10/4 $17.03 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Carmex $185.00/72 (.3502) $2.57 $233.00/600 (.1502) $0.39 $9.18/12 (.160Z) $0.77 NO BID NO BID




