RESOLUTION 2024-08-12-03
BE IT RESOLVED, that the Shelby County Commission hereby awards the bid for Sheriff’s Office
Uniform Accessories and Duty Gear to the lowest responsive bidder per group as attached. The
awarded bidders are MAC Uniform and GT Distributors, Inc.

Said eBid #2024-7-11491 is located within the office of the county’s Chief Financial Officer.



Walter Craig, Read's GT Distributors,
MAC Uniform LLC Galls LLC Uniforms, LLC Inc.
Group #1 - Uniform Accessories

Class A Dress Coat 225.00 No Bid 378.07 322.00 No Bid
Black Class A Tie 9.75 No Bid 10.99 6.00 No Bid
Dark Brown Class A Tie 9.75 No Bid 10.99 6.00 No Bid
Felt Campaign Style Hat 149.95 No Bid 183.99 137.00 No Bid
Class A Hat 95.00 No Bid No Bid 77.00 No Bid
Badge 185.00 No Bid 146.77 157.00 No Bid
Hat Badge 155.00 No Bid 124.64 130.00 No Bid
Name Plate (metal) 21.00 No Bid 34.96 24.00 No Bid
Rank Insignia (metal) 8.00| No Bid 22.13 8.00 No Bid
Patches 1.65/500] No Bid 2.22 3.50 No Bid

TOTALS GROUP # 1 860.10 No Bid 914.76 870.50 No Bid

*Used average price on Read's Dress Coat sizing/pricing. All others encompassed all sizes. Also used
average price on Galls Rank Insignia.

Walter Craig, Read's GT Distributors,
MAC Uniform LLC Galls LLC Uniforms, LLC Inc.
Group #2 - Duty Gear

Duty Holster 169.95 151.13 197.34 130.00 143.88
Handcuff Case Hidden Snap 35.95 30.40 40.50 37.00 32.63
Handcuff Case Open Top 31.95 22.73 36.00 32.00 24.40
Duty Belt (outer) 76.95 54.83 86.85 83.00 58.85
Duty Belt (inner) 41.95 29.83 47.25 46.00 32.02
Magazine Pouch 39.95 30.40 48.15 41.00 32.63
Magazine Pouch 33.95 22.73 37.80 37.00 32.63
Magazine Pouch 35.95 25.57 41.40 43.00 27.44
Belt Keeper(s) x 4 26.95 18.75 29.70 17.00 20.13
OC/CS Spray Holder 35.95 25.57 40.50 26.00 27.44
Radio Holder 47.95 41.19 53.10 50.00 40.86
Friction lock expandable baton 149.95 143.20 139.07 181.00 121.78
Side Break Baton Holder 35.95 58.76 40.50 66.00 47.62
Glove Holder 23.95 16.91 26.77 21.00 18.15
Flashlight Holder 3495 25.00 39.60 31.00 26.83
Flashlight 219.95 153.24 174.25 175.00 141.46
Tourniquet Holder 37.95 No Bid 35.87 38.00 2735
Handcuffs 36.50 32.39 32.15 32.00 26.50
Handcuffs 52.00 37.65 39.64 40.00 38.32
Color Coated Handcuffs 48.00 38.47 No Bid 32.00 34.75
Leg Irons 65.00 131.62 152.67 160.00 122.75
Belly Chains 105.00 89.21 137.95 105.00 94.88

TOTALS GROUP # 2 1,386.65 1,179.58 1,477.06 1,423.00 1,173.30




