RESOLUTION 2024-05-28-05

BE IT RESOLVED, the Shelby County Commission hereby awards the bid for Launchers and
Ammunition to the lowest responsive bidder for each item as highlighted below. The awarded bidders are
Gulf State Distributors and GT Distributors.
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FN 303 Launcher or equivalent Product-3228929290 137097 1,750.00] 1,777.78
GN303 clear mpact rounds or equivalent 48048554 40230 399.00 40698
FN302 Indelible Paint rounds or equivalent 48048552 40230 399.00 406.98
FN303 Inert Powder rounds or equivalent 48048610 402.30 399.00 406.98
FN303 Washable Pamt rounds or equivalent 48048555 40230 399.00 406.98
FN303 PAVA/OC Powder or equivalent 48048600 551.73 549.00 558.14
40MM Launcher or equivalent 1243 1182330 1,137.62 1,099.00 No Bid|
Direct Impact 40mm training rounds or equivalent 63300LE 1155370 1,428 53 1,369.00 No Bid
Exact Impact 40mm Standard range or equivalent 6325 1012225 25.67 399.00 No Bid|
Stinger 60 caliber 40 mm rounds or equivalent 6097 1011853 28.24 29.00 No Bid
First Defense OC Vapor or equivalent 43896 1156865 63.72 60.00 No Bid
CS gas Grenade or equivalent 1016 1012301 31.52 30.00 No Bid|
Stngball Grenade or equivalent 10878C 1152900 64.70 64.00 No Bid|
Low Roll I Distraction Device HH or equivalent 8922NRSC-HH |1200899 92.75 85.00 No Bid|

Said eBid #2024-5-11478 is located in the office of the county’s Chief Financial Officer.



