RESOLUTION 2024-05-13-05

BE IT RESOLVED, the Shelby County Commission hereby awards the bid for Reflective Safety
Apparel Class Il to the lowest responsive bidder for each item as highlighted below. The awarded
bidders are Southern Nameplate & Graphics and A&A Sales Associates, LLC.

The bids received from A&A Sales Associates, LLC. for items RAF 803 ST LM Baseball Cap and
RAF 799 ST LM Leg Gaiters are considered non-responsive because the requested logo was
omitted. Therefore, these items were awarded to Southern Nameplate & Graphics as the only
responsive bidder.

104 CT- 104 CT- | 204 CT-regular | 204 CT-regular Reflect50 Reflect50
Shirts regular regular | Llongsleeve Long sleeve Short sleeve Short sleeve
Short sleeve | Short sleeve | Button-up Button-up
ARA Sales SNG AR&A Sales SNG A&A Sales SNG
Cost per shirt | Cost per shirt | Cost per shirt Cost per shirt Cost per shirt Cost per shirt
Small $24.50 $23.10 | $27.50 $26.10 $39.75 $33.05
Medium $24.50 | 523.10 $27.50 $26.10 $39.75 $33.05
Large $24.50 $23.10 $27.50 $26.10 $39.75 $33.05
|
X-Large $24.50 $23.10 $27.50 $26.10 , $39.75 ‘ $33.05
|
[ 2Xlarge | 52450 $23.10 $27.50 \ 526,10 | 539.75 $33.05
T P— — l
T ax Large $26.10 $25.15 $29.50 $28.15 l $42.75 $34.75
large Tall |  $26.40 $25.15 $29.50 | $28.15 $84.75 No Bid
X-large Tall |  $26.40 $25.15 $29.50 | $28.15 $84.75 No Bid
i o R R
2X-large Tall | $26.40 $25.15 $29.50 $28.15 ; $84.75 No Bid
3X-large Tall |  $26.40 $25.15 $29.50 §28.15 No Bid No Bid
1 =




| Jackets | RAF413 | RAF413 | VEA-403- | VEA-803-T[ VEA-431- | VEA- | VEA-602- | VEA-602- | VEA-GOS- | VEA6O4- | VEA-604-  VEA-604-
| GT GT T Rain ST 431-5T | STLB STLB | GTIN GTIN | GTIN GTLN
I Bomber | Bomber Rain ‘ Jacket Parka Parka | Zipper Zipper | K Zip %Zip | Hoodie  Hoodie
| Jacket 1‘ Jacket Jacket ‘ Sweatshirt | Sweatshirt Sweatshirt | Sweatshirt | Sweatshirt ~ Sweatshirt
‘ | |
[ A&gA | snG AZA SNG AZA SNG A&A SNG | ARA NG| ARA ‘ SNG
| Sales | Sales Sales | Sales Sales Sales
small | $49.00 | $4200 | $36.00 | $30.00 &= $65.00 | $49.25 | $4800 | $4600 | 54075 $37.00 $6000 | $37.00
Medium | $49.00 | $42.00 | S3600 | S3000 & S$65.00 | $49.25 | $4800 | S4600 | $40.75 $37.00 $60.00 $37.00
Large $49.00 | $42.00 | 5$36.00 $30.00 $65.00 ! $49.25 $4800 | $46.00 $40.75 $27.00 $60.00 §37.00
T X-large | $49.00 | $4200 | $3600 | $3000 = 56500 | 54925 | 54800 | $4600 | 54075 | 53700 | S60.00 | $37.00
[ 2Xlarge | $49.00 | $42.00 $36.00 | $30.00 @ S6500 | $49.25 | $48.00 $46.00 $40.75 $37.00 56000 $37.00
T3Xlarge | $5400 | $46.10 | $4100 @ $34.10 | $7200 | 55335 | $54.00 | $50.15 $46.75 $41.10 | $65.00 54110
TXL-Tall | $5200 | 84405 @ NoBid | No Bid NoBid | NoBid | 55200 | $48.05 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
| | |
2XL-Tall | $52.00 | %4405  NoBid | NoBid NoBid | NoBid | $52.00 | $48.05 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
|
3XL-Tall | $56.00 | $4815  NoBid | NoBid NoBid | NoBid = $56.00 | $52.20 No Bid No Bid NoBid | Nosid
| ‘ .
RAF 583 ET RAF 583 ET RAF 583 ETLM | RAF 583 ETLM
.~ Vests A &ASales | SNG A & A Sales SNG
Cost per vest | Cost per vest Cost per vest Cost per vest
Small ? $19.95 $14.85
$15.10 $12.00
Medium $15.10 $12.00 $19.95 $14.85
Large : $15.10 $12.00 $19.95 $14.85
X-large |  $15.10 $12.00 $19.95 $14.85
2 X Large $15.10 $12.00 $19.95 $14 .85
3XLlarge | $17.25 $14.10 \ $22.25 $16.90
| |
" RAF804ST | RAF803ST | RAF803ST | RAF799ST | RAF799ST |
RAFLBJ“ At LM LM LM Lm LM
Ranger Hat Baseball Baseball Leg Gaiters Leg Gaiters
Ranger Hat
| [ Cap Cap |
Accessories | A&A Sales SNG A &ASales SNG A & A Sales SNG |
Cost per hat | Cost per hat | Cost per Cap | Cost per Cap | Cost per pair | Cost per pair |
Fits M M ;
its Most L $13.75 $11.50 51505:;)0”0 $13.60 $14.25 NO $16.50
LOGO
Jumbo LM $13.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Said eBid #2024-3-11468 is located in the office of the Chief Financial Officer.




