

RESOLUTION 2024-02-26-07

BE IT RESOLVED, the Shelby County Commission hereby awards the bid for Stone to be Picked Up to the lowest responsive bidder for each item as highlighted below. The awarded bidders are Vulcan Materials and Dunn Construction.

| | | RMUSA AGGREGATE | VULCAN MATERIALS | DUNN CONSTRUCTION | MARTIN MARIETTA |
|----------|----------------------------------|-----------------|------------------|-------------------|-----------------|
| ITEM NO. | SIZE & SPECIFICATION | BID PRICE - TON | BID PRICE - TON | BID PRICE - TON | BID PRICE - TON |
| | | BRIERFIELD | CALERA | | |
| | | | HELENA | | |
| | | | CHILDERSBURG | | |
| | | PICKUP | PICKUP | PICKUP | PICKUP |
| 1 | Class 1 10-100# RIPRAP | NO BID | \$27.00 | \$26.00 | \$30.00 |
| 2 | Class 2 10-200# RIPRAP | NO BID | \$27.00 | \$27.00 | \$30.00 |
| 3 | Class 3 25-500# RIPRAP | NO BID | \$27.00 | NO BID | NO BID |
| 4 | Class 4 50-1000# RIPRAP | NO BID | \$28.00 | NO BID | NO BID |
| 5 | 6" - 3" GABION STONE | NO BID | \$27.00 | NO BID | \$31.00 |
| 6 | A H D #1 STONE | NO BID | \$20.25 | \$23.00 | \$26.00 |
| 7 | A H D # 1 MODIFIED STONE | \$23.25 | NO BID | \$23.00 | NO BID |
| 8 | A H D #2 STONE | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID |
| 9 | A H D #3 STONE | NO BID | \$20.25 | NO BID | NO BID |
| 10 | A H D #4 STONE | \$21.75 | \$20.25 | \$23.00 | \$23.50 |
| 11 | A H D #5 STONE | NO BID | \$20.25 | NO BID | NO BID |
| 12 | A H D #6 STONE | NO BID | \$20.25 | NO BID | NO BID |
| 13 | A H D # 7 STONE | NO BID | \$22.00 | NO BID | NO BID |
| 14 | A H D #23 STONE | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID |
| 15 | A H D #57 STONE | \$22.75 | \$20.25 | \$23.00 | \$23.50 |
| 16 | A H D #67 STONE | NO BID | \$20.25 | \$24.00 | \$24.00 |
| 17 | A H D #78 STONE | NO BID | \$22.00 | \$25.00 | \$25.00 |
| 18 | A H D WASHED #78 STONE | \$23.50 | \$22.00 | NO BID | NO BID |
| 19 | A H D #8910 STONE | \$19.50 | \$18.75 | \$18.00 | \$19.50 |
| 20 | 825 A dense grade base | \$20.50 | \$18.75 | NO BID | \$19.50 |
| 21 | 825 B - 1 1/2 " #410 crusher run | \$20.50 | \$18.75 | \$18.00 | \$19.50 |
| 22 | 825 B - (PUG MILL MIXED) 1 1/2" | NO BID | \$18.75 | \$18.00 | \$20.00 |
| 23 | Surge | \$20.75 | \$19.25 | NO BID | \$27.50 |
| 24 | Miscellaneous scrap waste stone | \$16.25 | \$16.50 | \$14.50 | NO BID |
| 25 | Stripping Material | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID |

Said eBid #2024-1-11447 is located in the County Manager's office.