

RESOLUTION 2022-02-14-06

WHEREAS, the Shelby County hereby awards the bid for EMS-ALS Equipment to the lowest responsive vendor per each item listed according to bid specifications at the contract price listed for each unit. Shelby County Commission hereby records that no bids were received for items 1A, 2A, 3A, 4A, 5A, and 6A. Therefore, purchases will be made for these items as outlined by the State of Alabama Bid Laws.

Equipment Item No.	Vendor	Items	Price	Bound Tree	Henry Schein	Life Assist	Quad Med
0001 A	No bid	EZ-IO Power Driver		-	-		
0002 A	No bid	EZ-IO Pediatric Needle-Set Blue (Disposable) Box of 5		-	-	-	-
0003 A	No bid	EZ-IO Adult Needle-Set Yellow (Disposable) Box of 5		-	-	-	-
0004 A	No bid	EZ-IO Hard Sides Case		-	-	-	-
0005 A	No bid	EZ-IO Vascular Access Pack		-	-	-	-
0006 A	No bid	EZ-IO Complete Training Kit		-	-	-	-
0007 A	Life Assist	SAM IO Driver	\$125.40	\$145.50	\$129.73	\$125.40	\$1,345.15
0008 A	Henry Schein	SAM IO 45 mm needle kit w/extension	\$322.89	\$363.00	\$322.89	\$326.30	\$333.85
0009 A	Henry Schein	SAM IO 25 mm needle kit w/ extension	\$322.89	\$363.00	\$322.89	\$326.30	\$333.85
0010 A	Bound Tree	Length Based Resuscitation Tape	\$15.55	\$15.55	-	-	\$30.12
0011 A	Life Assist	ET Tube Holder, Adult	\$2.53	\$2.75	\$2.59	\$2.53	\$2.98
0012 A	Life Assist	ET Tube Holder Pediatric	\$2.53	\$2.75	\$2.59	\$2.53	\$2.98
0013 A	Henry Schein	ET Tube Introducer	\$4.02	\$4.42	\$4.02	\$7.20	\$7.21
0014 A	Bound Tree	Video Laryngoscope Kit	\$1,185.00	\$1,185.00	\$1,337.27	\$1,247.40	\$1,410.00
0015 A	Bound Tree	UESCOPE VL400 Video Laryngoscope Kit	\$2,255.00	\$2,255.00	-	-	-
0016 A	Life Assist	Portable Suction Unit	\$528.12	\$592.50	\$568.02	\$528.12	\$580.50

Said eBid 2022-1-11222 is located within the County Manager's Office.