RESOLUTION 2024-03-11- 05

BE IT RESOLVED, that the Shelby County Commission hereby awards the Fire Services
Equipment bid to the lowest responsive vendor per each item listed according to bid specifications at
the contract price listed for each unit.

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that the Shelby County Commission hereby records that no bids

were received for items 0035F through 0044F, and 0070F. Item 71F none of the vendors met the bid
specifications. Therefore, purchases will be made for these items as outlined by the State of
Alabama Bid Laws.

Equipment Vendor Item Price Kenco | NAFECO | Sunbelt Walter NOTES
Item No. Craig
0001 F NAFECO 6 NH Male x Female X 10 Ft Pvc Corr. Suction Hose $749.00 _ $749.00 ~ , 5
w02 | F | NAFECO | 57X 100 Ft Through The Weave Nitrile Supply Hose $999.00 . $999.00 ‘ . .
0003 | F | NAFECO | #7supply line hose $579.00 . $579.00 - " -
0004 | F | NAFECO | ¥ supply line hose $349.00 . $349.00 - .
0005 B NAFECO 2.5” attack hose 1.75" attack hose $249.00 B $249.00 B R
0006 F NAFECO 1.78" attack hose $219.00 _ $219.00 = 3 -
0007 | F | NAFEcO | 1.75" attack hose $243.00 " $243.00 - - -
0008 E NAFECO 17 x 50° Forestry hose, single jacket $139.00 _ $139.00 B _
0009 | F | Sunbelt 1” nozzle $619.00 - §749.00 | $§619.00 . .
0010 | F | Sunbelt 67 Female NH LH low level strainer w/jet siphon $506.00 $539.00 | $506.00
0011 | F Sunbelt 2.5" hydrant gate valve $424.00 - $449.00 $424.00 - =
0012 | F NAFECO | Hydrant Assist Valve $2,459.00 - $2,459.00 | $2,525.00 = =
0013 | F | NAFECO | 15" fog/straight stream nozzle $899.00 - $899.00 | $922.00 - -
0014 F Sunbelt 1.75"fog/ straight stream nozzle $922.00 B $979.00 $922.00 ~ _
0015 | F | Sunbelt 2.5"fog/straight stream nozzle $980.00 $1,07400 | $980.00 2 .
0016 | F | Sunbelt Rapid Attack Nozzle $4,158.00 : $4,809.00 | $4,158.00 - =
0017 | F | Sunbelt Nozzle shut off with smooth bore tip $629.00 . $669.00 | $629.00 - <
0018 | F | Sunbelt Low pressure fog nozzle tip for shut off $568.00 - $619.00 | $568.00 5
0019 | F | Sunbelt 2.57 to 1.5” swivel reducer $209.00 - $22000 | $209.00 - -
0020 | F | NAFECO | 3 gallon poly back pack $239.00 = $239.00 . .
0021 | ¥ | Sunbelt 2.5 gallon fire extinguisher $153.00 - §21600 | $153.00 . =
0022 | F | Sunbelt 57 STORZ inlet X two 2127 gated wye $673.00 $680.00 | $673.00 .
0023 | F NAFECO | 57 STORZ inlet x two 57 storz gated wye $2.479.00 $2,479.00 | $2,750.00 .
0024 F NAFECO 5 x manifold 5”storz inlet x5”’storz gated outlet x four 2-1/2” $3,242.00 - $3,242.00 $3.396.00 - B
0025 I SiAbEE 6" NH Female Swivel Inlet X 5' with Storz Outlet $2.019.00 $2220.00 | $2,019.00 : s
0026 | T Sunbelt Water thiel $1,760.00 - $1,799.00 | $1,760.00 -
0027 | I NAFECO | 57 Cap With Chain $129.00 . $120.00 | $190.00 - -
0% | F | NAFECO | 41/2" NH Rigid Rocker Lug Fem. x 5" NH Male $119.00 . $11900 | $184.00 i §
0029 | 1 NAFECO | 2300 gal dump tank $1,699.00 . $1,699.00 | $1,750.00 - :
0030 | T Sunbelt F'oam eductor. pyrolite 95 gpm $1,257.00 s $1,380.00 | $1,257.00 g .
0031 | F | NAFECO | Set Of Four X Spanner Wrench And Holder §139.00 $139.00 | $145.00 s 2
0032 | B Sunbelt 2" Kernamantle rope $322.00 - $336.00 $322.00 2




0033 | F | NAFECO | Fireman's rope hose tool $169.00 $169.00 - - -
0034 | F | Sunbelr Rope Bag $88.00 : $91.00 $88.00
0035 | F | NOBID K-12 Gas Saw T5-420 $0.00 - ) . s
0036 | F | NOBID Chamsaw Gas MS 291 $0.00 2 : - .
0037 F NO BID K-12 Battery Saw TS-230 $0.00 = - ” -
0038 B NO BID Chain saw battery powered MS-220 $0.00 ~ R . B
0039 | F | NOBID Battery AP 300 $0.00 - - - -
0040 | F | NOBID Charger AL-300 $0.00 . > - : :
0041 B NO BID Chainsaw battery powered MS-120 $0.00 ~ R B
0042 | | NOBID Battery AK 20 $0.00 x - :
0043 | F | NOBID Chasger AL 101 $0.00 - :
0044 | F NO BID Back pack blower $0.00 N - .
0045 F Sunbelt Stamless Steel Locking Carabineer $58.00 $63.00 $58.00 R
0046 F Sunbelt CMC Clutch 13 mm device $749.00 _ $819.00 $749.00 _ R
0047 | F | Sunbelt 6 Pound Flat Head Axe §74.00 $83.95 $88.00 $74.00 < 5
0048 | F | Sunbelt 6 Pound Pick Head Axe $76.00 | $8595 |  $92.00 $76.00 . 2
0049 | F | Sunbelt 3" Deywall Hook with D handle (Yellow) $108.00 | §113.00 | $133.00 | $108.00 ; -
0050 F Sunbelt Firehooks Unlimited 6° New York Hook $135.00 ~ $196.00 $135.00 N B
0051 | F | NAFECO | Firehooks Unlimited 10" New York Hook $206.00 - §206.00 | §225.00 = :
0052 | F | Sunbelt 36” Halligan Tool $281.00 = $339.00 | $281.00
0053 F Sunbelt Firehooks Unlimuted Probar Halligan Tool $285.00 = $339.00 $285.00 .
0054 | F | Sunbelt 8 pound sledgehammer (Yellow) §143.00 = $174.00 | $143.00 - -
0055 | F | Sunbelt 10 pound sledgehammer (Yellow) $65.00 $89.02 §79.00 $65.00 3
0056 | F | Sunbelt 4 pike pole with D handle (Yellow) $98.00 | $114.00 |  $129.00 $98.00
0057 | F | Sunbelt # drywall hook with butt handle (Yellow) $85.00 | $104.00 | §115.00 $85.00
0058 | F | Sunbelt 6' pike pole with butt handle (Yellow) $78.00 . $128.00 $78.00 -
0059 F Sunbelt Steck Big easy lock out tool with case $98.00 $98.00 _ R _
0060 | F NAFECO Quick deploy spring traffic cone, 5 cone bag $299.00 2 $299.00 N 5
0061 | F | Sunbelt 4 Gas Monitor $1,100.00 : $1,100.00 - -
062 | F Suibale 4 Gas Monitor truck mounted charger/cradle $345.00 R $345.00 R _
0063 | F | Kenco Door bar $279.00 | $279.00 | $299.00 | $355.00 - -
0064 | F | NAFECO | W-tool-ge $1,749.00 ! $1,749.00 - : =
0065 | F <;$11-? Eespotipht Liwbo Postalle Hlandigh $175.00 | s21500 | 17900 | $185.00 | $175.00 :
Tt
0066 | F gi‘g‘ E-tlens Lt L. Rexhacgable Lisies $19400 | $236.50 | $199.00 | $205.00 | $194.00 -
wer | F :‘ii:; SRS o RN I SRR $187.00 | $226.00 | s19900 | s20000 | $187.00 .
0068 | F g::ﬂ;;r aeivne postabls led bandtighid $131.00 | 15400 | $149.00 | $140.00 | $131.00 .
0069 | F fyﬂm Parkibic sk lght cechatguabile lastern $687.00 | $75800 | $749.00 | $755.00 | $687.00 :
Craig ; ] ! ; :
0070 F NO BID Whelen Pioneer Life LE35 Light $0.00 . _
0071 E NAFECO Rechargeable, pistol grp waypont 300 rechargeable spotlight $0.00 $151.00 $69.00 $126.00 $115.00 E:E,: i
0072 | F | NAFECO | lame Green Safety Vests $19.00 s $19.00 < .
0073 | F | Sunbelt Structural Fire Helmet $375.00 s 41500 | $375.00 5
0074 | F | NAFECO | Firepro 300 $999.00 ; $999.00 - 2 -




0075

NAFECO

Attack Pro Seres

$3,554.00

$3,554.00

0076

Kenco

K-tool kit

$179.00

$179.00

$219.00

$180.00

Said eBid # 2024-1-11442 is located in the County Manager’s office.




